IN THE JACKSON COUNTY CHANCERY COURT, MIS 0k

CYNTHIA N, ALMOND, etal | FIL ED PLAINTIFF

'VERSUS . APR 04 2017 CAUSE NO. 2014-2653
J .
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM, ef ) - -CRIDGE, CLERK DEFENDANT

MOTION TO RECONSIDER THE COURT’S RULING OF MARCH 29,2017,
MOTION TO LIFT STAY, REMOVE SPECIAL FIDUCIARY
. STEPHEN SIMPSON, AND FOR OTHER RELIEF

COMES NOW the Plaintiff, CYNTHIA N. ALMOND, by and through her attorneys of
record, DENHAM LAW FIRM, PLLC and BARTON LAW FIRM, PLLC, and files this, her motion
to Reconsider the Court’s Ruling of March 29, 2017, Motion to Lift Stay, Remove Special F iduciary
STEPHEN SIMPSON and for Other Relief, and in sﬁpport thereof would show as follows: |

. Plaintiffs would show that this Court has jﬁrisdiction over the subject matter and the
parties herein.

2.‘ Signed on Sept‘ember 29, 2015, but 'ofﬁcial_ly ﬁled on October 7, 2015,.this Court
appointed Special Fiduciary, STEPHEN SIMPSON, over the Singing River Health System
Retirement Trust plan over the objection .of Plaintiff. Order attached hereto as Exhibit “A”,

3. Former Special Master Britt Singletary presided over the hearing and issued the
Order appointing SIMPSON as the Special fiduciary. Former Special Master Singletary and the
former presiding Chancellor L. Breland Hilburn signed the Order prior to their ultimate recusal on
February 4, 2016, after multiple recusal motions and an exposed secret ex parte meeting scandal.

4, On January 11, 2017, -Judge Bell reaffirmed the Court’s stay for all motions untelated
to the bills submitted by the special fiduciary, as he z.lr'ticulated that all future bills were to be
submitted by the Special Fiduciary énd his counsel in the form of a motion with any objections due

within ten (10) days of the Special Fiduciary or his counsel ‘ﬁling a motion for payrﬁent, and a




response to any objections due pri;)r to the signing of any order for payment or neceésitating'a
'hearing. Plaintiff avers that tﬁe Stay isA currently lifted fqr the purposes of payment to the special
fiduciary, yet an Order has not been entered staﬁng same, so Plaintiff respectfully requests that this
court lift the Stay for the purposAet of Hearing this Motion to prevent further irreparable harm upon the
Plaintiff and those similarly situated.

5. Plaintiff is still investigati;lg the gross billing discrepancies in STEPHEN
SIMPSON’S bills and will request a lifting of the stay to conduct additional discovery.

6. Plaintiff would show that Special Fiduciary, STEPHEN SIMPSON, mailed interested -
parties, including Plaintiff, a copy of all formerly presented billing statements, associated Orders and
.cu;‘rent motions for payment. The CD ‘was also inclusive of quarterly reports for Singing River
Health System (not included herein)'. A copy of the CD and all billing documents burned on the CD

“are attached hereto as Exhibit “B.” Plaintiff avers that this is the first time she has been given any
bills prior to the one submitted to this Court which was appfoved by the Order on January 13, 2017,
after a hearing on the expenses with Judge Bell.

7. Plaintiff would show that STEPHEN SIMPSON has submitted past bills to the
Jackson County Chancery Court from Septémber 16, 2015, until December 31, 2016, with the
months of September 2016, November 2016, and December 2016, being in the form of a Motion to
the Court requesting approval for payment, and as of the filing of this date, invoices which have not .
yet been paid. |

' 8. - Plaintiff would show that the Hearing to appoint Special Fiduciary was held on
September 29, 2015, with Special Master Singletary, and filed with this court on October 7, 2015, yet
"Special Fiduciary SIMPSON billed abproximately. $14,492.00 from September 16, 2015, until
September 29, 2015, and was paid from the failing pensioﬁ fund, per the December 3, 2015 Order |

signed by Former Chancellor Hilburn, attached hereto as Exhibit “C”. Special Fiduciary STEPHEN



SIMPSON  billed retroactively and prior to this Court’s approval of his Special Fiduciary
appointment, fraudulently.billing morle th-an 55.2 hours from his firm.

9. Plaintiff avers that she has, up until February 2017, received no invoices or the
accompanying Orders for Payment since the invoices were submitted without proper motion and in
the Broun v. SRHS and Lay v. SRHS cases, not in the Almond v. SRIS, which prevented Plaintiff
from reviewing and objecting to the payment of the invoices.

10. Upon receipt of the' paid invoices and the Motions for Payment submitted by
‘STEPHEN.SIMPSON, Plaintiff is concerned that should STEPHEN SIMPSON not be removed from
his position, irreparable harm may cc.>me‘to her and those similarly situated, as the actions with regafd

.to the biliing by the Special fiduciary are looting the alyeady depleting fund by an ‘average' of
approximately $20,920.00 per month, for a totale’f $292,883.00 submitted for payment to this Court,
with payment having been, and to be,II‘enaered from the failing pension fund.

11, Special Fiduciary SIMPSON has billed more than one-hundred and seventy-three
(173.6) hours to date in large blocks of time, four hours to nine hours at a time, with no description
attached to the billing amount or time, creating undocumented billing. In these instances, the invoice
shows the initials of the person billing, a blank section where the description of the action is to be
written, and the amount of time spent on the action, the hourly rate, and then the running total.
Special Fiduciary SIMPSON has billed for undocument'e'd actions the months of September 2015,
November 2015, February 2016, Ai)ril 2016, August 2016, statements attached hereto as Exhib"it

“«“D”. This undocumented billing has resulted in approximatély $43,400 in paid funds from the
Pension Fund with no documented legitimacy.

12. Additionally, SPECIAL FIDUCIARY has billed more than nine-hundred and fifty

(950) hours for “research,” “review” of documents and finances, and “plan amendments” over the

course of approximately fifteen (15) months. With that many hours, and $237,500.00 later, one



would expect to have a report rendered to this court and the parties with drafted findings, proposed
amendments, or something which would show the fruit of his labor.

13. Plaintiff would aver that the billing practices rather careless, as they are all in solid
hour increments, sometimes in eight (8) hour blocks for several days in a row. It ié few and far
between when a lawyer bills a solid éight (8) hours in a day, much less several days in a row. This
'billing practice has the appearance of impropriety, and makes one question the accuracy of the billir}g
' by the Special Fiduciary.

14, Additionally, it appears there are odd{ties in the formatting of the billing which méke :
one questioﬁ the billing system sinceT the formatfing is different on random months, which doesn’t
appear consistent with a c.hange in billing systems. See Exhibitr“E” which is the bill formatting for
the months of September and October, 2015, and January, May, June, and July 2016.

15. On September 23, 2015, STEPHEN SIMPSON attended the Jackson County hearing
which began at approximately 1 p.m., and concluded within just a couple of hours, yet SIMPSON
billed a solid eight (8) hours on that date. (September 2015 bill attached hereto as Exhibit “F”), '
Additionally, Special Fiduciary SIMPSON bills that day as “Jackson County Court Hearing, Me'eting
with Speciai.l Master, Britt Singletary, Re;/ie.w SRHS ﬁnam.:ial docs.” Through the course of that day,
SIMPSON does not allocate any time or travel expenses for travel to Jackson County, or specif;w
times attending Court. Additionally, this bill was subr'nitted- havi‘ng a pagination of “1 of 8 pages and .
then becomés inconsistent stating it has a paginatién maximum of “5” pages.

16. Special Fiéucial'y' STEPHEN SIMPSON has allocated a total of eight (8) hours for
web development and design, and in fact, in February 2016, bills four (4) hours for “Website creation
for Social Fiduciary and Beneficiaries,” yet to date, no website has been implemented. A web
developer can build a complete website for a fraction of the costs for which SIMPSON has produced

nothing. (February 2016 bill attached hereto as Exhibit “G.”)



WHEREFORE PREMISES CONSIDERED the Plaintiff respectfully requests thaf the Court

will RECONSIDER its ruling of March 29, 2017, GRANT Plaintif’s Motion to Lift the Stay,

remove Special Fiduciary Simpson, and she further requests any additional relief which the Court

may deem appropriate.

Respectfully submitted this the } & dayof April, 2017.

BY:

BY:

CYNTHIA N. ALMOND

EARL L. DENHAM, MS Bar Number: 6047
DENHAM LAW FIRM, PLLC

424 Washington Avenue (39564)

Post Office Drawer 580

Ocean Springs MS 39566-0580
228.875.1234 Telephone

228.875.4553 Facsimile
earl@denhamlaw.com

W. HARVEY BARTON, MS Bar Number: 2104
BARTON LAW FIRM, PLLC

3007 Magnolia Street

Pascagoula, MS 39567

228.769.2070 Telephone

228.769.1992 Facsimile
harvey@wbartonlaw.com

o dose bt~

W. HARVEY BARTON, MSB #2104




CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
I, W. HARVEY BARTON,.do hereby certify that I have this day forwarded via electronic
.m-ail service, facsimile and/or first class postage prepaid, a true and correct copy of the above and

foregoing Motion to the usual and regular electronic mail/facsimile/mailing addresses of all counsel

of record.

SO CERTIFIED this the Lﬁz‘ day of W ,2017.

A

W. HARVEY BARTON, MSB #2104
BARTON LAW FIRM, PLLC

3007 Magnolia Street

Pascagoula, MS 39567
228.769.2070 Telephone
228.769.1992 Facsimile
harvey@wbartonlaw.com
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IN THE GHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI @PDQ ! 0,\%;
TERRY GLERK
IN RE: Singing River Health Systetn Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust EP&
Almond, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No., 2014-2653

Thompson, ef ¢, v, Singing Rlvcr Health System, ¢f al.; Cause No,2014-2695

50

‘Bosarge, ef al. v. Singing River Healtlr System, et cd Cause No: ?.Omwu.;
Aguillar, ef al. v, Singlag River Health System, ¢f al,; Gause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No, 2015-0001
Broun, ef al, v. Singing River Henlth System, er al.; Cause No. 2013-0027
Biland, ef ¢f. v, Singing River Healtlt Sysﬁnin, et al.; Cause Mo, 2015-0030

Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et gl.; Cause No, 2015-0060

ORDER REGARDING REMOVAL OF PLAN TRUSTEES AND

APPOINTING SPECIAL FIDU(‘TARY

These civil actions are before the Court on a motion for removal of trustees in the Broun
case (Cause Nb. 2015-0027) and in the Lay case (Cause No. 2015-0060) and before the Court on
their own initiative, sua sponte, concerning other similar civil actions pending in the Jackson
County Chancéry Court (as referenced heréin above by Caﬁé;e_.Nos,), in accordance with Section
41-8-706(a) of the Mississippi Code of 1972, Annotated, as amended. These cases concern the
operations, property, assets, and funding of the Singing River Health System Employess’
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”). As such, the subject matter of this litigation
addresses trust property, as defined and recognized under seotion 91-8-103(20) of the Mississippi
Code of 1972, Annotated, as amended. Jurisdiction and venue are proper i this court, Miss,

Code Ann, §§ 91-8-202, 91-8-203 and 91-8-204, This Court therefore assumes lts role herein, in
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sccordance with Miss. Code Ann. §91-8-201, regarding the statutory duty in administration of the

subject trust,

In or about 1983, the Singing River Heaith‘System originally ereated and designed the

subject refiroment trust, This benefit pehsiﬁx plan covers its full-time employees hired before
October 1, 201 1.' Under the terms. of the plan, Sing}ng River Health System is designated as the
“Bmployer” and “Plan Administrator” of the pension plan, §1.15 and §10.01. The plan likewise
dictates that a Board of Trustees will govern the funding and viability of the plan, §10.02.
Fusthermore, the plan provides that a “Member” is “art Employee who becomes a Member ...,
and ... continues to be entitled to any benefits under the Plan..” §1.19. The overall purpose of the
Plan allows .M‘embers to defer income untit or after the termination of their employment with

Singing River Health System and provides retirement income to such Members.

.The Tr_ustecs of the Plan have the responsibility for determining the amount of
contributions to be made by Singing River Health System.and for making the contributions
necessary to provide benefits desoribed under the Plan. §§1Q.02 and 10,03, Indeed, the Plan
vests the exclusive responsibility and powers necessary to perform the following duties and
functions with; such Trustees;

- (&) To receive, hold, preserve, manage, and at the direction of the Plan

" Administrator, invest and reinvest the Trust Fund, so that the Trast Fund’s
integrity and safety will be maintained for the purpose of the Plan,

(b) To make disbursements from the Plan, to or for the benefit of Plan Members,
- their heirs and beneficiaries, as may be directed from {ime to time by the
Committee; _

¥ AlL such teferences are to provisions or sections In the subject retirement pension plan.
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(¢) To perform such additional duties and functions as may be requested from
time 1o tite by the Board of Trustees of the Bmployer, the Plan Administrator,.or
the Committee.

§15.01(a), (b) and (¢). In performing these duties, Trustees are.charged with “doing so in the
interest of the members and beneficiaries solely, using the care, skill, prudence und diligence
under the circumnstances then prevailing that a prudent man acting in a like capacity and familiar

with such matters would use in the conduct of an enforprise of like character.” §15.02.

As alleged by the plaintiffs and as admitted by Singing River Health Systems, no
contributions to the Plan have been miade sinee 2009, While Singing River Health Systems

contends that any contributions to the Plan are discretionary, the Plan language specifically states

as follows:
[Singing River Health System)] shall make such contributions from time to time,
which in addition to contributions made by members pursuant to section 9.02
shall be necessary as defermined by the Actuary to provide the benefits of this
A Plan, , '
§9.03

This case is governed by the terms and prbvisions of the Mississippi Uniform Trust Code.
Section 91~8~’2 06 of t'ﬁat statutory ;:Jody provides that a court may remove 4 irustee for several
reasons, Those reasons are t,ﬁat “['1] [fJhere has been a substantial change of circumstances, [2]
the court finds that removal of the trustee best sorves the interests of all of the beneficiaries and
is not. iticonsistent with a materia! purpose of the trust, and [3] a suituble sotrustee or successor
trustee 1s available.” Section 91-8-706(c) also provides that “[plending a final decision on a
request fo remove a trustes, ot in liew of or In addition to removing « frustee, the court may'or.der
suct_x appropriate relief under Sec"cion 91-8-1001 (b) as may be necessary to protect the trust

property or the interests of the b;:neﬁciaries.”
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Among the remedies, provided under Section 91~8-100'1, is the authority for a court to
“appoint a special fiduciary to take possession of the trust property and administer the trust.”
Miss, C_ode Ann, §91-8-1001(b)(5). Furthermore, a court is empowered to “[o}rder any other
appropriate relief whether provided elsewhere in this chapter, available at common law or under

equity principles,” Miss. Code Ann. §91-8-1001(b)(10).

While the parties dispute whether contributions are vequired to be made to the plan, it is
olear from the documents submitted thus far to the court that substantial losses to.the plan
investments, and therefore the trust property, have occurred. Whether these losses are
attribﬁtabie to-actions or inactions on the part of the curren"c'p'lan trustees ig &lso a matter of
dispute, Moreover, the amount of iosscs and the amount of Qomributions not made to the pian are
the ,s'u'bjcot of numerous motions and discovery matters currently pending before the court,
Nevertheless, as authorized by Sections 91-8-706 and 91-8-1001, this court has the statutory and
equitable authority to (a) determine that a “substantial change of ciroumstances” has ocourted,
(b) find that the removal of the frustees best serves the interests of all of the beneficiaries and is
not inconsistght with a material purpose of the trust, and (¢) suitable cotrustee of successor

trustee, ot, as set forth in Section 91-8-1001(b)(10), a special fiduciary, is available,

Therefore, considering the above and foregoing tactors, as well as the claims and
defenses asserted by the parties in these cases, the court determines that, pending a final decision
on a request to remave the trustee; the followlng interim decision is made, in accordance with

Seotion 91-8-706 and Seation 91-8-1001 (b):

1. The court hereby appoints Stephen B. Simpson,as a Special Fiduciary to take

possession of the trust property and to administer the trust, including all plan assets and property,
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as defined and contemplated under the Mississippi Uniform Trust Code, Miss. Code Ann. §§91-

8~101, er seq.; , ¢

5. The curfent frustees of the Retirement Trust are ordered and compelled to account and
furn over to t&é Special Fiduciary all trust assets and property; however, the current frustees are
hereby ordered and compelled to continue benefit payments to ourrent retirces under the

Retirement Trust and Plan, as dircoted by the Special Fiduciary or order of this Court;

3, The current trusteas of the Retirement Trust are enjoined from taking any action
concerning the trust property and assets or otherwise administering the trust without the

exprossed written approval of the Special Fiduciary abpointed horein;

4, The aforesaid Special Fiduciary appointed herein is granted all power and authority

prescribed by the Singing River Health System Employecs’ Retirement Plan and Trust;

$, The aforesaid Special Fiduciary appointed herein is likewise granted all power and

authority set forth under the Mississippi Uniform Trust Code; and

6. Ihc aforesaid Spvctal Fsduomry shall be paid by Singing River Health Systems from
non-Trust ﬁmds or property, at an hourly rate of $250.00, plus all reasonable and necessary wsts
and expenses ‘which the Special Fiductary may incur in the performance of the aforesaid dutles,

power and authority.

7. The aforesaid Special Fiduciary may be appointed Trustee of the Retirement Trust in

the event of the resignation of the current trustees.

8, The aforesaid Special Fidueiary shall have the right to retain outside counsel o further

and protect the assets and interests of the Pension Plan,
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9. Honorable Terry Miller shall remain Receiver for Limited Purposes pursuant to the
Order of'this Court dated June 8, 2015, Mr, Miller shall be compensated for his work beginning

when he leaves office from the Trust funds at an hourly rate of $150.00 per hour,

IT IS, THEREFORE, ORDERED that Stephen B, S1mpson is hereby appointed as the

Specla] ]qduomry of the Singing River Health System Fmployces Retirement Plan and Trust

IT 1S, FURTHER, ORDERED, that the current tmstecs of the Singing River Retirement
Health Systerﬁ Bmployees’ Retirement Plan and Trust shall comply with the sbove terms and

provisions as ordered herein, pending resignation or removal,

[T IS, FINALLY, ORDERED that this interim order; pending a final decision, shall

remain in full force and effect until further order of this court.
e

. PR
SO QRDERED, this the Q ? day of Septernber, 2013,

MA

SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT JUDGE 7\\

Atlested . ( 'E { u){., .
To be g true copy of ongma! 0 KA

Filed_(rdo\oe ~ N 207 16

Terry Miller, Chancety Clerk :".'." '

s °*6VV' nsoiipls /4%
ByC ,.‘ : ‘,v'
WY
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Apr. 4. 2017 9:23AM  Denham lav firm No. 2466 P. 2

IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust FI LE D
B 8015
Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef af; Cause No, 2014-2653 DEC 032015

Thompson, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al; Cause N0.2014-2605  TE \ Ouﬁall\‘l.\f , CLERK
Bosarge, ef al. v. Singing River Health Systern, et al.; Cause No, 2014-2729 BML
Aguillar, et al. v. Singing River Health System, e al,; Cause No, 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, et al. v. Singing River Hcalth System, ef al.; Cause No, 2015-0027

Eiland, et al, v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0030
Lay, et al_ v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore ferus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special  Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Tmst"’) for authority to pay Deutsch
Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having considered the same
finds, Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 483625 dated November 30, 2015, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of September 16, 2015, through October 30, 2015, is hereby

approved for paymeat by the Retirement Trust.

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment
by the Retirement Trust. Néwg&r%
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED thisthe % day of el, 2015,

Attested

To be.a true cony of orlginal Ot
Filed Q{‘g&bﬂx 3 20 1%

Terry Miller, Jhancery Clen(

y@ﬁon Caofnty, L,ussremppf "
B D.C.
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Submitted by:

ste€ on behalf of
the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.
2510 14" Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
T: (228) 864-0161
F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




Apr. 40 2017 9:23AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P, 4
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2540 14th Streel, Sulte 1001
Gulfporl, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278

FEIN  72-0929299
02424-00001 ' Invoice No; 483625
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 11/30/2016
AND TRUST

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L, BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: .
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 10/31/2015 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

- Fees $38,617.00
Expenses $16.50°
Tofal Current Charges $38,633.50

Please reference our Invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orloans, LA 70130
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Apr. 4. 2017 9:23AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P. 5

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
Inquiry Activity Bllled Report (9/16/2015 - 10/31/2015)

Client/Matter: 02424 SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST / 02424-00001

_———— — . e et Ve s

Bill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

. Hours Eees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp, Dlscount Total
Billed: 155.70 38,617.00 0.00 18.50 0.00 39,633.60
Emplovee Recap: Hourg . Eees Cash Exp. Non-Gash Exp, Discount Total
0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 2.20 242,00 0.00 0,00 0.00 242,00 .

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 153.50 38,3756.00 0.00 16.50 0.00 38,391.50




Apr. 40 2017 9:23AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P 6

Billed Values
Date TkprliExp Activity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees
09/16/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
RFP's and proposals,
09/18/2015 0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 220  110.00 242.00

Singing River Trust case - Research MS codes and articles for trusts for Steve Simpson, create an indexed hook for easy
aceess and use wilh a new case he just got in

09/18/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 7.00  250.00 1,750.00
MS Model Trust Act. 80-8-1 et seq.

09/21/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ’ 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Read and analyze SRHS employee retirement trust agreement.

09/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
SRHS financial docs. KMPG annuat audlls. Horne audil. madia reports.

09/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON B.0D  250.00 2,000.00
Jackson County Court hearing, Meeting wilh Special Master, Britt Singeltary. Review SRHS financial docs.

00/26/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON - 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
SRHS investment pollcy and MS Trust Act

00/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00 . 250,00 1,000.00
To Jackson County esurthouse for hearing on Motion to appolnt Special Fiduciary and objeclions/Retum o Guifport.

09/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3.00 250.00 750.00

09/30/2045 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 030 250.00 75.00
Telephone call will WIll Vankirk of Vankirk invesiments regard! fund investments and meeling requesl.

09/30/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10 250.00 2500
Text from Bob Sawyer regarding fund invesiment advice.

09/30/2016 08684 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.10 250.00 25.00
Text message fiom Sherman Muths, Muths valuations regarding fund investment and valuation advica.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2.00 250.00 500.00
Meeting with counsel for membars, Jim Reeves regarding stalus and mediation.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.80 250.00 1,200.00
review and make recommendalions to Term Sheet regarding settlement on behalf of Trust.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.30 25000 75.00
Telephone call with Special Master ragarding Order and responsibilities described therein,

10/01/2016 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON 200 250,00 400,00
Review pleadings in State and Federal court cases,

10/01/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.30  250.00 325,00
Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding oppostunity to manage trust.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 010 25000 25.00
Emall from Sawyar investments.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.20 250,.00 300.00

Meeting with Will Van Klrk, William Van Kirk and Alan Sala regarding rust investment,
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Apr. 40 2017 9:23AM  Denham lav firm No. 2466 P. 7
Billad Values

Date Ikpr/Exp Activity Descrintion Qty Rate Amount

10/04/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2.00 250,00 500.00
Plan and Trust Documents.

10/02/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00  250.00 1,000.00
Pleadings in sfale and federal lawsultes.

10/07/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.00 250.00 250.00
Telephone conference call from 10:00 lo 11:00 wilh Brett Williams, Lee Bond, Kevin Holland, Marty Moderson, Celest Oglesby,
Cralg Sumlmerlin of SRHS regarding {ransition of trustes dutles.

10/12/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00

) Review Latest SRHS Employees' Retirement Pian and Trust Agreement, provided by counsel for SRHS and investment poll;:y.

10/13/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2.00 250.00 500.00
Read and review Investment Policy of the Singing River Health Syslem Employees Retlrement Plan and Trust, provided by
counsel for SRHS.

10/13/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.30 250.00 75.00
Raview SRHS and SRHS Relirement Plan cont list provided by counsel for SRHS

10/13/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.90 250.00 476.00
Review Diversified DB Outsourcing Agreement, Dlversified Penslon Servises Agreement and Diversified Signalure Authortzation
Form provided by counsel for SRHS. _

10/13/2015 0084 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 3.00 250.00 750.00
Revlew amendments to SRHS Plan provided by counsel for SRHS (2 inches of documents)

10/13/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.70 260,00 175.00
Review contract with Fiduclary Vesl for investment advise.

10/14/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 020 25000 50.00
telephone call from Vic Welch regarding plan administration interest.

10/14/2015 D864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 3.00 250.00 750.00
Meeﬁng at Vian Kirk Weatth advisors with Will Van Kirk Sr, Alan Sala, William Van Kisk il regarding Investment advisor jnterest
presentation.

10/14/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
Review Investment Statements provided by counsel for SRHS.

10M5/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10 250.00 25.00
Telephone call to Michael Schlogel, Hancock Bank regarding meeting schadule, '

10/15/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON : ‘ 6.20 250,00 1,650.00
administrative fees and cost analysis per plan documents and quarterly statements

10/16/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.00 250,00 250,00
Revlew presentation documents from Hancock Bank.

10/19/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 150 250.00 375.00

‘ Meeting with Hancock Bank executives, Michael Schiogel, Dave Lundgren, Trey Frey, and Brent Fairley regarding
investment,cuslodial and financlal advisemant services.

10/19/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 2,00 250.00 500.00
Meeting al Peoples Bank with Chevis Sweatman, Ann Guice and Tom Wicks regarding Investment seivices,

10/19/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.50 250.00 375.00
Review presentation documenls from Hancock Bank

10/19/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3.00 260.00 750.00

Compara investment policy against recommended allacation.

2/14/2017 2:14 PM Page 3 of 5
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Date TkprlExp  Actlvity Description
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Recievelreview mark lo market accounting summarles for Aug. and Seplember 20156,
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Tolfrom Jackson county courthouse and attend hearing before Judge Breland.
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
_ Revlewfanalyze proposed selllement term sheel.
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email la Jim Reeves regarding tort ciaim notlce on behalf _of Plan and Trusi.
10/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
: Draft recommendatlons and revisions to settlement term sheet.
10/24/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email response from Jim Reeves regarding fort claims notice
10/22/2015 0884 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Taping of news show at WLOX.
10/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Review submissions by Vankirk wealth Invesiments regarding lrust administration
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call with Marty moderson regarding plan modificalion.
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call with Jim Reeves regarding tort claims notice.
10/23)2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON .
Tealephone call to Semmes Bobo al Billy Guice office regarding rust fund stalus.
10/23/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Telephone calls lo iduclary Vest,
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call lo Stewart sneed-and hughs regarding fiduciary Bond.
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Review benefit plan and trust for needed amendments as discussed wilh Marty mordson
10/292016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON '
Telephone call with Harold Small, Fiductary Vest requesting reports.
10/26/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

10/27/2016 0884 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON
Email to Joey Beattie with Stewart, Sneed and Hewes regarding fiduciary liability policy.
10/27/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

10/26/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Prepare application for fiduciary liabllity poficy,

10/26/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Meeting with loey Beattle / Stewart Sneed and Hewes regarding fiduciary liability policy.

211412017 2:14 PM

No. 2466 P. 8
Billed Values
Qty  Rate Amount
0.40 250.00 100.00
4.00 250.00 1,000.00
1.00 250.00 250.00
020 250,00  60.00
2.80 25000 626.00
010 25000  25.00
1.00 250,00 250.00
4.50 250.00 1,425.00
D40 25000 100.00
020 26000 50.00
0.10 250.00 25.00
020 25000  50.00
0.20 25000  50.00
3.50 | 250.00 875,00
030 25000  75.00
4.00 250.00 1,000.00
0.30 26000  75.00
460 250.00 1,160,00
1.00  250.00 250.00
150 250.00 375.00

Page 4 of §
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Date TkpriExp  Actlvity Description
10/28/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Toelaphone call with Joey Beattie al Stewart Sneed and Hewas regardin Fiduciary liability policy.

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call from Ashley Reed, Bancorp South schediling meeting for tuesday 11/3.
10/29/2015 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON )

Telephone call from Cree Cantrell/ Edward Jones scheduling meeting,
10/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Correspondence from Van Kirk Wealth Advisors. 4 pages
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Meetling with Cree Cantrell/ Edward jones investmenls regarding pension plan investments,
10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Review email submission regarding Plalnliffs (lm Reeves) emall and term sheel amendments, and SRHS (Brett Williams) lerm

sheet amendments as preparation for meetlng.
10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

No. 2466 P 9
Billed Values
Qty  Rate Amount
0.10 25000 25.00
010 25000 2500
0.10 25000  25.00
0.30 26000  75.00
3.00 250.00 750,00
3,00 25000 750.00

4.00

To Jackson County to Bretl Wililame office 1o participate In seltlement term sheet negollations/retum te Gulfport.

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

1.50

Review and anylize DRAFT STIPULATION AND AGREEMENT OF COMPROMISE AND SETTLEMENT,

10/30/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Retumn telephone call to Dan Webb regarding Chub coverage issue.

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

0.10

0.70

Telephone call with Dan Webb regarding coverage Issues for SRH System. Trust Intervention in dispute.

Totals: 155,70
Expenses
10r28/2016 E101 137.00
Copylng
10/20/2015 E101 28.00
Copying
Totals:  165.00
Report Totals:
2/1412017 214 PM

250.00 1,000.00
250.00 375.00
250.00  25.00
25000 175.00
38,617.00

040 13,70
010  2.80
16.50

38,633.50

Page 5 of 5
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FILED

IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPY AN 18 201

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust é(;SH ELDRIDGE, CLERK

Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et at; Cause No. 2014-2653
Thompson, e . v. Singing River Health System, ef of; Cavse No.2014-2695
Bosatge, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No, 2014-2729
Apnillar, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health »Systcm, et al,; Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cauge No. 2015-0027
Filand, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause N 0. 2015-0030

Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No, 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore tenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”) for authority to pay Deutsch
Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court havihg reviewed and
considered the same finds it is reasonable and faix, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 485754 dated December 17, 2015, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of quember 1, 2015, through November 30, 2015, is hereby
approved for payment by the Retirement Trust,

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment
by the Retirement Trust. fL

ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this tha,,../. ﬂz day of January, 2016,

=’ l)u, /

Attested '..;;

To be a true copy of original 0( Q% (\.ﬂ( (; S
Fiied J0- \> 20 [ ¢ o~ /x
Josh Eldridge, Chancery Clerk i r/ SPECIAL CI‘IANCER.Y COURT JUDGE ~

Jackean Coupty, Missigsippl
By — 06 '.:-",
;',/. ..... .\(.
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Submitted by:

Special Fld\)mary Trusteeo bchalf
the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P,

2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

T: (228) 864-0161

F. (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




Apr.

4. 2017 9:24AM Denham law firm No. 2466
Deutsch Kemrlgan LLP
R - »~ ' agazine Stre
% DeutschKerrigan o O LA 7013

T. 504 581 5141
deutschkerrigan.com

December 17, 2015

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
AND YRUST

C/O HON. L, BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

POBOX 2114 -

JACKSON, MS 239225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Our Refarenca: 0242400001

Enclossd please find our firm's Invoice for professlonal services and costs incurred in connection with the handling of
the above referenced matter.

[ trust that you will find this stateraent in order and ask that you please place it In fine for payment at your eeriest
convenience, Please forward your paymenl to:

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
755 Magazine Street
New Orleans, LA 70130

If you have any queslions regarding the invoice, please do nol hesitate lo conlacl me.
With kind regards, | ramain

(

o

Cordially,

STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

P,

12
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Deutsch Kerrigén LLP

2510 14th Streat, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161 Fax: (228)863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001, _ . Involce No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH 8YSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Data: 12/17/2015
ANU TRUST : .

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
- C/O HON, L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39226

For services rendered for perlod through 11/30/12015 In connection with: |

Reference No. 02424-00001
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Fees $30,825.00

Expenses $0.00
Total Current Charges $30,6825.00

Please reference our invoice number with yaur remiltance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

.Page 1 of 8




Aor. 4 2017 9:24AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P 14
02424-00001 _ invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 12/1712016
AN TRUST
Professional Services
DATE D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
11/02/2015 SBS  L130  Prepare and plan for quarterly trustoe meeting and 8.00 260.00 2,000.00
A1 investment racommendations from Fiduclary Vest. :
11/03/2015 SBS L1130  Review Fiduciary Vest Investment Performance 3.40 250,00 850,00
Al04  Evaluation Report for the period ending Seplember 30,
2015, (101 pages)
11/03/2015 SBS 1130  Altend Meeting with Ashley Reed and Trust Department 1.50 250,00 375.00
A409  head from Bancorp South regarding Investment
opportunilles.
11/03/2015 SBS L1130  Review emall and attachment from TIR investment, Tim 0.80 250.00 200.00
Aq04  Harllgan regarding recommendation on investment : .
amendment at lrustee meeting 11/4.
11/03/2015 SBS L1130  Telephone call with Joey Beattie regarding flduclary 0.10 250.06 25,00
a1a7  liabllity policy.
11/04/2015 SBS L1100  Travel tof from guifport office to Singing fiver hospital for 1.50 250.00 375.00
A112  truslee meeting.(45 min each way)
11/04/2015 SBS  L270 Singing river frustee meeling, 2.80 250,00 700.00
A109
11/04/2015 SBS L110  Receive and review Proposed amendments to the 1.60 250.00 375.00
A104  Bgreements of Eastern Timberland Opportunities I, Inc.
and ETO Il operaling Partnership. L.P,
Amendments to SRHS Trust investiment TRI,
11/04/2015 SBS 1100  Prepare for Trustee meeting, Sepl. minules, agenda and 2,50 250.00 625.00
Ad04  review fiduciary Vest 3/4 report.
11/05/2015 8BS L1100 Review correspondence dated Nov. 4th from Jim Reeves 0.20 250.00 50.00
A104  to Judge Hilburn, Singletary, Houston and Simpson. -
- 11/05/2015 SBS L130  Telephone call with Morgan Slanley jacksan MS 0.50 250,00 125.00
Al07  fegarding investment services, Meeting request.
11/05/2015 SBS L1100 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A101

Please reference our involea number with your ramittanca.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 8
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02424-00001 Invoice No! 485764
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invaice Date! 1211712016
AND TRUST
11/0672015 SBS L110 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102
11/09/2015 SBS L100  Emall with document attachment from Jim Reeves., 0.20 250.00 §0.00
o A107 ’
11/09/2015 SBS Email from Jim Reeves with drafl agreament attached. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A07
11/09/2015 SBS L160  Review and analyze setlement (draft) proposal 1.00 250.00 250.00
A104
14/09/2015 SBS 6.30 250.00 +1,575.00
A102
11/10/2015 SBS L1100 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102
111172015 SBS  L100 8.00 25000  2,000.00
Al03
1111212015 SBS (110  Telephone call from employsa/ Tadlock regarding tort 0,20 250.00 50.00
. Alog  Cclaims notice
11/12/2015 spS  L110°  Emall tort claims notice to employee Tadlock, 0.10 250.00 25.00
A108 '
111122016 SBS L130  Email from counsel for SRHS celest Ogelsby regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
alo7 lele conf. with TransAmerica. Response
11/12/2016 SBS L1160  Recieve and review latest settlement draft from Jim 1,00 250.00 250.00
A104 Reeves.
11122015 sBS L1130  Meeting with Cree Cantrell /Edward Jones investmenls 1.00 250,00 250.00
’ Af09  regarding investment services. )
11/12/2015 SBS L130  Meeling with Victor Walsh / Malletle Administralors, Inc 1.00 250.00 250.00
" A109 regarding Investmant administration. ’
1111212015 SBS 130  Review financlal investment presentation from Edward 1,70 250.00 425,00
A104 Jones, .

Please reference our Invoice humber with your remittanca.

Dentsch Kerrigan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of B
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Denham law firm

No. 2466 P. 16
02424-00001 Involce Not 486764
SINGING RIVER HEALTH 5YSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 121712016
AND TRUST -
11/12/2015 8BS L110 3.00 250.00 750.00
A102
11/13/2015 SBS L1130 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104
.11/116/2015 SBS 1430  Telephone call with Marty Modersen regarding Order for 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107  Plan amendments and wednesday conf.. call,
11/16/2015 SBS L160  Receive/ review praposed drafl of setlement documents 1.80 250.00 450.00
A104 and exhiblts,
11/16/2015 SBS L1100 Recsiva and review SECOND CORRECTED ORDER 0.60 250.00 150.00 -
A104  Aappoinling Special Fiduclary Truslee
11/16/2015 SBS L100  Telephone call with Special Master, Britt Singeltary. 0.10 250.00 25.00
' A107 '
14/16/2015 sBS  L100 Meetling with financial inveslment vendor for 5,00 250.00 1,250.00
A109  Presentalion/ proposal, Cree
11/116/2015 SBS  L100 telephone call to Marty Moderson regarding Second 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107  corrected Order
11/16/2015 $BS L100  Telephone call to Celest Ogelshy regarding Second 0.10 250,00 25.00
A07  corrected order.
1116/2015 8BS L1100  Talephone Conf. with Marty Moderson. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A107
111712015 SBS L100  Revise Second Corrected Order appoinling Special 1.00 250.00 . 250.00
a103  Fiduciary Trustes, ‘
11/17/2015 SBS  L100  Email to counsel for SRHS, Celeste Ogelsby regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
. A107  Second Correcled Order. :
111712015 SBS L1100  Telephone call with counsel for Plaintiffs, Jim Reeves 0.30 250.00 75.00
A107  regarding Stipulation and settlement agreement.
1111712016 SBS 1160  Email to Jim Reeves regarding Slipulation and 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 setllement agreement.

Please reference our invelce number with your ramiftance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 4 of 8
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No. 2466 P 17
02424-00001 Involce No: 485764
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 1214712016
AND TRUST
1111712018 SBS L160 revise stipulation/settlement agreement regarding 6.10 250.00 1,625.00
A103 contribufion payments, ot al
111712015 SBS L1100  email from counsel forSRHS, Kelly Sessums regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107  Second corrected order.
1118/2015 - SBS L100  Telephone conf, with SRHS counsel, Marty Moderson 1.00 250,00 250.00
Af07  and representatives of Transamarica regarding coli :
' check etal. .
11/18/2015 SBS L130 Teleﬁhone conf, with Les Bonb SRHS GFO, Celest 0.50 250.00 126.00
) Aoy Ogelsby, Marty Moderson regarding Coll benefit and
. recommendation to SRHS Board.
11182015 SBS 1100  Recelve and review 2009 letler to-members regarding 1.70 250.00 425,00
A104  coli benefit, review Plan and Trust document regarding
coli benefil formula, revlew Transamerica pension
modaling document dated 9/9/2015 :
11/18/2018 SBS L160  Revlew lalest stipulation and settlement draft from jim 0.80 250.00 225.00
af04  Reeves,
111812015 SBS L1110  Email from Nleole Tillman regarding Cofl. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
11/18/2015 SBS U110  email from Frank Carberry @ TransAmerica regarding 0.40 250.00 25.00
Af07  Pension plan model.
1111612015 SRS  L100 Recelve and review Second Corrected order draft and 1.50 250.00 375.00
. A103  Proposal from Marty Moderson Order
11/18/2015 SBS 1100  Email from counsel for SRHS, Celest Ogelsby. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107
11/16/2015 8BS L100  Telephone call to Fiduciary Vest, Jason Small, 0.10 250,00 25.00
A107
11118/2015 SBS L110  Review plan docurents and financal status to defermine 2.00 250,00 500,00
Al03  coll benefit vrecommendation.
11119/2016  SBS Telephone conf. with Lee Bond, Kevin Holland and Marly 0.70 250.00 176.00
A102  Moderson ragarding 2015 GOL! benefit,
11/19/2015 8BS Draft and revise nolice lo beneficiaries per Plan 2.00 250.00 500.00
Af02  requirements on 13th check. email fo Lee Bond, et al for

commentls,

Plaase rafarence our involce numbar with your remittance,

Dautsch Karrgan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 5 of 8
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No. 2466 P, 18
02424-00001 Invoice No: 486764
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN invoice Data: 12/17/2016
AND TRUST
11/19/2015 $BS Telephone message to Jason Small, Fiduciary Vest. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A102
14/19/2015 58S ‘Telephone call from counsel far plainfifis, Jim Reeves 0.20 250.00 50.00
At02  regerding latest proposed stipulation and seltlement
agreement. :
1110/2015 SBS L110  Telephone call with Jim Reeves regardind settiement 0.40 250.00 100.00
A107  and stipulation.
11/19/2015 8BS 1120  13th check memo and jusUﬂcatilon basls, 2.00 250.00 500.00
A103
11119/2015 SBS 1210  Circulale revised Second corecled order revisiona and 2.00 250.00 500.00
Afo3  make changes .
11120./201 5 SBS L1130 telephone conversalion with Jason Small, Fiduciary Vest 0.30 250.00 76.00
Af07  regarding monthiy accounting and reporting of trust
principal balance.
11/20/2015 SBS L100  Telephone call wilh SRHS counsel, Brelt Williams 0.10 250.00 25.00
Af07  regarding emergency board meeting 1:00 today.
11/20/2015 SBS 1110  Make final revision to 5.06 nolice letter regarding 13lh 0.50 250.00 125.00
Af03  check
11/20/2015 SBS L100  Aftend emergency special meeting of the Board of - 3.00 250.00 750.00
A109  lrustees of SRHS to discuss 13th check issue. Travel -
to/from gullport to Gautler.
11/20/2015 SBS L100  Telephone call with SRHS ceo , Kevin Holland. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
. 11/20/2015 8BS L100 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A103
1112312015 SBS L100  Revise 13th check notice with changes from Board 1.00 250,00 250.00
A103  Mmeeting.
11/23/2015 sBS  L100  Telephone call with Kevin Holfand, SRHS. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107 :
11/23/12015 SBS L100  Email to Nicole Tlllman regarding conf. call. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A107

Please referance our involce number with your remittance.

Dautsch Kerdgan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orlaans, LA 70130

Page 6 of 8
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No. 2466  P. 19
02424-00001 Invoice No; 485754
SINGING RIVER MEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN involce Date: 12/17/2018
ARD TRUST
11/23/2015 SBS L100  Telephone co.f with special board meeting of SRHS to 0.50 250.00 125.00
Afa7 recommend payment of 13th check.
1472512015 SBS 1100  Email thread with Kevin Holland regarding notice 1o 0.30 250.00 75.00
Alp7  fetirees of 13th check and web posiing.
11/3012016 SBS L1100 Telephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Jim Reeves’ 0.20 250.00 50.00
A407  regarding selilement proposal, Motion to sever.
11/30/2016 8BS 1410  Emall to counsel for plainlifs, Ear Denham regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107  Meeting request.. :
11/30/2015 SBS Email response from Earl Denham office regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
AMo7  Meeting request.
11/30/2015 SBS 1210 Palition to approve 13th check and corresponding Order. 0.80 250.00 200.00
A103 '
11/30/2015 SBS L1110 lelephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Earl Denham 0.10 250.00 25.00
AN07
117302015 SBS L1120  Meeting with counsel for plaintiffs, Earl Denham 1.20 250,00 300,00
Ad07  Tegarding future joint effoits lo benefit Plan and Trust.
11/30/2015 58S L160  Telephone conf. with court and parties. 0.50 250.00 125.00
A107
‘Fee Total  123.30 /hrs 30,825.00

Expenses

Please refarence our involce number with your remittance.

Dautsch Kerrigan LLP - 766 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70430

Page 7 of 8
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02424-00009 ‘ ' involce No: ABET54
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENY PLAN involca Date: 12117/2016
AND TRUST

Timekaeper Summary

Timakeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 123.30 250.00 $30,825.00
Totals ' 123.30 $30,825.00

f—-n

ToRL

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Date Invoice Pilled Credits Balance
Total Outstanding Balance $0.00

Please raference our involce number with your remittance.

Deutsch Karrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 8 of 8
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IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPL

- IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust — g 2 570

éOSH ELDRIDGE, CLERK
Y.

Bl-oun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ¢! ¢/,; Cause No. 2015-0027
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef «l.; Caunse No. 2015-0060

L -

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore tenus of Stephen B, Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”) for aﬁthority to pay Deutsch
Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and
considered the g@e finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and .Adjud.gcs:

1. Invoice No. 487435 dated Ianﬁary 7, 2016, submitted by i)éutsc:h Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of December 1, 2015 through December 31, 2015, is hereby

~ approved for payment by the Retirement Trust

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoicé for péyment ‘

by the Retirement Trust.

- :/#-”/
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the _ 420'( day of February, 2016.

pX)

L S p M.
% a‘?.: . . : /(‘;”:j % . /,.,...,
ML e W] 2 : 2
"l g ¥ ..'l'"‘ ’ 04 '_%' P
. 3:'7 v Q\P—;“‘f,w‘,{;'f- : . /% ///
REIRY ol -5“\ Attested : 1AL, CHAN TUD
. P SN e) copy of ongma / SPEC ¢ CERY COURT OF
. < (i*r'('ét} ; '
T Ty ey O ~ JOSh Eldndge Chance Ci
1001 ry Clerk
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Submitted by:

Specxal F]dumary Tmstee on behalf of
- the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
* Deutsch Kerrigan, LL.P.* -
2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001
- Gulfport, MS 39501
T: (228) 864-0161
F: (228) 863-5278 _
- ssnnpson@deutschkemgan com
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Deutsch Karrigan LLP
755 Magazne Street

&% DeutschKerrigan e Oty A 0430

T. 504 581 5141
deutschkerrgan.com

January 7, 2016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
AND TRUST '

C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE:
SPEGIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Our Reference: ~ 02424-00001

Enclosed please find our firm's invoice for professional services and cosls incurred in connectlon wilh the handling of
(he above referencad matiar.

( trust hat you will find this statement in ordar and ask that you please place it in line for paymant al your earilest
convenience. Pleass forward your payment to;

Deutzch Kemigan LLP
755 Magazine Streel
New Odeans, LA 70130

Ifyou have any questlons regarding the invuice, pléase do not hesilate to contacl me.

With klnd regards, | remain

Cordially,

I Z
g’%mwsmﬂfw

P.

23
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Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2510 14th Slreel, Suile 1001
Gulfport, MS 308501
Talephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax; (22B) B61-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001 : o Invoice No: 487435
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES’ RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 01/07/2016
AND TRUST y

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L, BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 139225

For services rendered for period thraugh 12/31/2015 in connection with:

Reference No. 02424-00001
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Fees $35,350.00
Expenses , $16.80
Total Current Charges $35,386.80

Please refoerence our involce number with your remittance,

Deutsch Karrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Slreet New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10f6
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Denham lav firm

No. 2466 P, 25

02424-00001 Involce No: 487436

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date; 01/07/2016

AND TRUSY

Professlonal Services

PATE I DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE  AMOUNT

12/01/2015 SBS L130  Reviaw expert reports/financlals/data. 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104

121022015 SBS L1100  Meeting wilh Charles Mikhail regarding ©1.00 250.00 250.00
Al05  status/sellement/mollon hearing.

12/022015  SBS 1230  Travel lo/from and attend stalus/settlement/motion 3,00 250.00 750.00
A109  hearing in Jackson Counly courthouse, Meeling with

Scolt Taylor, Truslee .

12/02/2016 SAS L1600  Telephona conf. with Jim Reeves regarding stipulation ©0.30 250.00 75.00
A101 Iangu:age

12/02/2015 sBs Email/response regarding court ordered meeting 0.20 250.00 50.00
A01  lomomrow moming.

12/02/2015 8BS prepare andscan and email documents for processing to 0.50 250.00 125.00
A101  Transamerica.

1200212015 SBS Telaphone eall with Kim Langlois at Ttransamerica. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A101

12/02/2015 SBS Review complaint flled by Denham/Barton law firm. 2.80 250.00 700.00
A101

12/03/2015 SBS L1110  Research Plan Agreement terms for mandalory 5.00 250.00. 1,250.00
A102  contributions and termination authority of SRHS lrustees.

12/03/2015 SBES 1230  Attend cont. woth counsel for all parties wilh Judge 3.00 250.00 750.00
Afog  Houston al Special Master Singletary office.

12/03/2015 SBS L100  Telephone call with Jim Reeves, 0,20 250.00 50.00
A108

12/03/2015 SBS L1100  Talephone call with Jim Reeves. 0.20 250,00 50.00
A108

Ptease reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 766 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 8




Apr,

4. 2017 9:25M

Denham law firm No. 2466 - P. 76
02424-00001 ) . Invoice No: 407435
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPILLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Dafe: 01/07/2016
ANDTRUST
12/0412015 SAS L130  Review exper datalevalualion of SRHS financial 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102 condltion.
12/07/2015 SBS L130  Review expert financial analyals of condition of SRHS, 8.00 250,00 2,000.00
A102
12/08/2015 SBS ) research/review financlal dala regarding SRHS provided 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
. Ato2 by counsel for Plalntiffs.
12/09/2015 sBS - L1130 Review exper\lﬂnéncial analysis of SRHS. 8.00 250,00 2,000.00
A102
12/10/2015 SBS L1060  Meeling with counsel, Charles Makhail regarding 1.00 250.00 250,00
Af05  Intervention and complaint.
12/10/2015 SBS L130  Review financlal dala Jexpert analysls of SRHS. 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
Al02
12/11/2015 SBS L130  Analyze financial records of SRHS provided by counsel. 6,00 250.00 1,500.00
A104
12/15/2015 58S L110  Letter from Brett Williams regarding agreement with 0.50 250.00 125.00
Al04  county
121162015 SBS 110  Email from Jim Reeves regarding lelephone Conf. with 0.10 250.00 256,00
A104 Court.
12/16/2015 SBS L160  Talephone call wilh Jim Reeves regarding Conf. Call 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 - agenda lhls morning,
12/16/2015 $S85 L160  Court ordered conf. call with all parties by judge Houslon. 1.00 250.00 250.00
At07
1211612016 SBS L110  Review financial records in preparation for madiation. 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
A104
12/16/2016 SBS L110  telephone calt with Jim Reeves. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
12/16/2015 SBS L1410  Telophone call with Celest Ogelsby. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107 :

Please rafarance our mvalce number with your remittance,

Deutsch Korrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of




Apr. 4 2017 9:25AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466  P. 27
02424-00001 Invoice No: 467435
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Data: 01/07/12016
FNDTRUST
121612015 SBS L160  Telephone call with Jim Reeves regarding sellement 0.30 250.00 75.00
A107 languaga,
121172015 SBS L160  Cour ordered medlation with Judgs Houston, 8.00 260.00 2,000.00
A109
12/18/2015 SBS L110  Revyiew /analyze plah financial slatemanls 2003-2011 8.00 250.00 2.000.00
A104  and Plan Investment performance report 2014. :
122472015 SBS Review/analyze SRHS financial slatements 2003-2013. 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Af04  Cash flow slafemenls.
122212015 SBS L100  Telephone call with Charles Mikhail regarding complaint - 0.40 250.00 100.00
Ajos  attached to Motion lo intervene.
1212212015 8BS 1210  Review/ revise Complaint attached to Motion lo inlervens 2.00 250.00 500.00
A104
121222015 SBS L1130  Analyze financial data of SRHS Plan and Trust. 6.00 250,00 1,500.00
A104
1212312015 SBS L160  Comespondence from counsel for jackson county, Billy 0.20 250.00 50.00
At04  Guice regarding court approval of fiduclary release.
12/23/2015 SRS Analyze financial records SRHS 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
A106
12123120186 SBS L1130  Telephone call from Marty Moderson, TransAmerica 0.10 250.00 25.00
Al0s  regarding settlement,
12/28/2016 SBS 1210  Draft Motion and Order authorlzing seftlement 1.00 250.00 250.00
A103 agreement,
12/282015 S$BS L100  Email to counset, Charles Makhall ragarding Motion lo 0.10 250.00 25.00
Afog  Authorize settiement.
1212812015  SBS Email response from counsel, Charles Makhall, 0.20 250.00 50.00
A108
1212812015 SBS 1210  Review redraft of Complaint from Coqnsel Charles 1.00 250.00 250.00
A104 Makhail.

" Pleasa referenca our invelca number with your rawlitance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Straot New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 4 of 6




Apr. 4 2017 9:26AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P. 28
02424-00001 Invoice No: 487435
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 01/07/2016
AND TRUST
12/28/2015 SBS Continue analysis of financlal condition of SRHS 6.00 250.00 1,500.00
A106
12/28/2015 SBS L1100  Telephone call to Joey Bealy regarding Flduciary liabilily 0.10 250.00 25.00
12/29/2015 SBS L1130  Analysls of financial records SRHS 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A108
12/30/2015 SBS L210  Emil from Cal Mayo regarding fiductary complaint. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
121302015 SBS 1210  Emall from counsel, Charles makhail 0.10 250.00 25.00
A106
12/30/2015 SBS 1210 Revlew new drafl and red lined version of Flduciary 1.00 250.00 250.00
Al04  complaint
12/30/2015 SBS L110  Telsphone call with counsel Charles Makhail regarding 0.30 250.00 75.00
Afos  complaint strategy and amendments,
12/30/2015 SBS  L210  Revise ﬁduciary complaint. 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A103
Foe Total  141.40 mrs 35,350.00
Expenses
DATE DESCRIPTION UNITS RATE AMOUNT
12/02/2018 Copying 17 0.10 1.70
1210212015 Copying 6 0140 0.60
1211012015 Copying 137 0.0 13.70
12110/2015 Copylng 8 0.0 0.80
Expense Total 16.80

Please reference our Invoice numbar with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 766 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 5 of 6
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02424-00001 Invoice No: 487435
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN invoice Dats; 01/07/2018
ANUTROST
Timekeeper Summary
Timekoeper Name Hours Rale Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 141.40 250.00 $356,350,00
Totals 141.40 $35,350.00

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Date invoice Billed Credits Balance
12/17/2016 485754 $30,825.00 $0.00 $30,825,00
Tolal Outstanding Balance m

Please raference our invoice number with yeur remittance.
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
Page 8 of §




Apr. 4 2017 9:26AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P 30

INTHE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI

FILED

MAR 2 4 2016

o . : JOSH ELD
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al., Cause No. 2015-0060 By RIDGE, CLERK

IN RE: Sh{gir{g River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust
Broun, ef al. v; Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0027

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore tenus of Stephen B. Sinlpson; the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of tile Singing River Health System Erriployces’
Retirement Plan and Tfust (“Retirement Trust”) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invloice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and copsidered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 4‘88317 dated February 24, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of January 1, 2016, through January 31, 2016, is hereby
approved for payment by the Retirement Trust.

2, The S pécial Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment:

by the Retirement Trust. /
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the {2/ day of-February, 2016.

SPECIAL CERY COURT JUDGE =~

""'7 . Attested
’ . To be {'% eco y of orlglnal
22 LIt —~—— Filed I W0ACIA JY 20 |07

#68 Spcc1al Fiduciary Jﬁgzkc‘d“dgoﬂn“\hanczgs%%:k
Trustee on behalf of the Health System % W & D.C.
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com

Submitted by:




Apr,

4. 2017 9:26AM  Denham law firm : No. 2466

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
755 Magazine Street

ea DeUtSCh Kerrigaﬂ New Orleans, LA 70130

T. 504 581 5141
deutschkerrigan.com

February 24, 2016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
AND TRUST

C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: .
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Our Reference:  02424-00001

Enclosed please find our firm's invoice for professional seivices and cosls incurred in connaction with the handling of
the abave referenced matter,

I trust thal you will find this stalement [n order and ask that you please place it in line for payment al your earliest
convenlence. Please forward your payment to:

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
765 Magazine Street
New Oileans, LA 70130

)f you have any questions regarding the invoice, please do nol hesitate lo contact me.

With kind regards, | remaln

Cordlally,
%// 7

STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

P

3




A?r. 4. 2017 9:26AM Denham law firm

-~ No. 2466 P 32
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telophone: (226) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5276

FEIN  72-0929289
02424-00001 Invoice No: 48817
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date! 02/24/2016

AND TRUST

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX 2114 .

JACKSON, MS 39225

For services rendered for period through 01/31/2016 in connection with:

Reference No. 02424-00001
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Fees $32,000.00 .
Expenses $1.10
Total Current Charges $32,004.10

Please reference our Invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Streat New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10f 6
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02424-00001 Invoica No: 488317

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Pate: 02]24/2016

Professional Services
HOURS RATE AMOUNT

DATE D DESCRIPTION

01/04/2016 sBS 1210 Review and research Motlon to recuse speclal masler 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
A104 and attachments, affidavits. Review and research Motion
to recuse Judge Hilburn, affidavits and attachments,

01/04/2016  SBS 1210  Review revised complaint for filinf 1.00 250.00 250.00
A104
01/05/2016 sBs 210 2nd Motion o recuse Judge Hilburn, affidavits and 7.50 250.00 1,875.00

Al04 attachments. Motion ta resume discovery, et al.

01/06/2016 sps 1210  Email from counsel, Charles Makhall regarding amended 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 complaint.

01/06/2016 sps  L210 Review Federal court case pleading regarding settlernnt 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Af04  hotice and class certification, et al

01/07/2016 sgs L1210  SRHS Motion to strike affidavits, attachments. Special 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Atos  fid Motion/Order to intervene. SRHS Motion to stay
proceedings.

01/08/2016 spS 1210  Prepare for Motion hearing and responses to motions. 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
A104

01/08/2016 S L110  Emalillo coungel Charles Makhall. 0.10 250.00 256.00
A107

01/08/2016 sps U110  Email from counsel Jim Reeves. 0,10 250.00 25.00
A107

01/08/2016 sBs 1110  Telephone conf. with counsel, Harvey Barton regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00

ato7 ot claim notice letters.

01/08/2016 SpS L1110  Emailto counsel, Charles Mikhail regarding tort clalms 0.10 250.00 25.00
A105 letters to Harvey Barton.

01/41/2016 sgs 1100  Telephone conf.call with attorney's regarding 113116 0.40 250,00 100,00
AO7 status/motion hearing.

Please reference our involce number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 6
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Denham law firm

No. 2466 P 34

02424-00001 Invoice No: 4ABH317

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN invoice Date: 02/24/2016

01/11/2016 GBS L1210  Review Order granting Motion to infervene. 0,50 250.00 125.00
A104

04/11/2016 8BS L130 Financlal docs. 7.40 250.00 1,860.00
A104

01/12/2016 sas L1120 Email with memo attached from counsel, Charles 0.50 250.00 125.00
A104 Mikhﬂ“.

01/12/2016 sBs L130  Financial docs. 7.50 250.00 1,8756.00
A104

01/13/2016 sps 1210  Review and analyze pleadings in circuit and chancery 7.90 250.00 1,975.00
A104 complaints.

01/1472016 sps L2410 Review/analyze Motion for preliminary approval of class 8,00 250.00 2,000.00
A104 cartification/settiement.

review and analyze SRHS motion to stay and for
injunctive relisf.

01/15/2016 sBS L1130 Email from/response Michael Schiogel, Hancock Bank 0.20 250,00 $0.00
A105 regarding trust investments.

01/15/2016 gpS 1130  Email from Tom Wieks, Peoples Bank regarding 1/19 0.10 260.00 25.00
A105 meeting.

01/16/2016 spg  L120  Telephone call to counsel, Earl Denham regarding effect 0.10 250.00 25.00
A105 of stay Order on statute of limitations; filing complaints.

01/15/2016 $pSs  L120  prepare for fed court hearing. teview pieadings. 3.80 250.00 956,00
A104

01/18/2018 sgs L120  Telephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Jim Reeves. 0.20 250.00 50,00
A107

01/18/2016 sps 1120  Telephone call with parties to fed case. 0.30 250.00 75.00
AtO7

01/18/2016 58S Telephone call with counsel, Jim Reeves. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107

01/18/2016 sps 1120 Telephone call with counset, Charles Mikhail. 0.20 250.00 60,00
A105

Please reforence our involce humber with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazl

ne Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 6
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No. 2466 P. 35
02424-00001 jnvoice No: 488347
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 02/24/12016
01/18/2016 sas L1120 Meeting with counsel, Charles malhail. 1.00 250.00 250.00
A105
01/18/2016 spS L110  Printand review/analyze Supreme Court Motion from 3,00 250.00 750.00
A105 Denton/Barton. Research jgsues.
01/19/2016 sBS  L130 Meeting in Biloxi at Peoples Bank with Chevis Sweiman, 2.00 250.00 500.00
A7 Tom Wicks and Anthony Meyer of SEl Investments
ragarding pension plan Investments. .
01/19/2016  SBS L1410  Meeting with Charles Makhail 1o execute complaints In- 2,00 260.00 500.00
A105 Circuit and Chancery court againt Jx County and SRHS
to be filed today. Review Complaints.
01/1972016 GBS L340  Raview expert financlal data. 6.00 250.00 1,500.00
A104
01/19/2016 sEs 1210  Review §.Ct. Order requiring response to emergency - 0,10 250.00 26.00
A104 petition,
01/20/2016 sps L340  review expert financial data. 6,50 250.00 1,625.00
A104 ’
01/20/2016 sBs  L120  Meetwith counsel prior to fed. court hearing. ~ 0.50 250,00 125.00
A105
01/20/2016 sgs 270  Fed. court hearing on motion for prefiminary approval of 2.00 250,00 500.00
A109 class cedification/settiement. SRHS motion to Stay.
01/21/2016 sps 1210  S.Ctfiling, review analyze respond 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104 '
01/22/12016 sBS 1210  S.Ct. filings, exhibits responses. review/analyze and 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104 draft. -
04/25/2016 sBs L1110 Financial records of pension plan investments. 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104
04/27/2016 sgs L1110  Telephons call with SRHS employse David Gress 0,40 250.00 100.00
A106 regarding Fed. court settlement, et al.

01/28/2018 sBs 1130 Investor conference call with Efliott Investof. 1.00 250.00 250.00
' A106

Please reference our invaice number with your remittance, '

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, 1A 70130

Page 4 of 6
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No. 2466  P. 36

0242400001 \nvoice No: 488317

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 02/24)2016
01/28/2016 sBs L110 Review/ analyze December statements for retirement 3,00 250.00 TS0.0d

Af04  Plen.
Fee Total  128.00/hrs " 732,000.00
Expenses

DATE DESCRIPTIDN UNITS RATE AMOUNT
04/11/2018 Copying 11 010 1.10

Expense Total 1.10

Please reference our involce number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
Page 5of 6
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| | No. 2466 P 37

invoice No: 488317

2424-00001
Invoice Date: 0212412016

]
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 128.00 250,00 $32,000.00
— S s

126.00 $32,000.00

Totals

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Date Invoice Billed Credits Balance
b _dnvoiee T~ e
01/29/2016 487435 $35,366.80 $0.00 $35,366.80
e
Total Outstanding Balance $35,366.80

Please reference our involce number with your romlttance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 6 of 6
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4. 2017 9:26AM Denham law firm No. 2466 P. 38

INTHE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, Mississprt 1 1L ED

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employées".Retirement Plan and Trust MAY 06 2016 .
. J
Broun, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.,; Cause No. 2015-0027 BSSF J ELDRIDGE, CLERK
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef of.; Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on m-otioh ore tenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singiﬁg River Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”.) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Coﬁrt having reviewed and co.nsidefcd the same
finds it is reaéonable and fai;, and Orders and Adjudges: |

1. Invoice No, 489502 dated March 18, 2016, .s'ubmitt'ed by ‘Deutsch Kexrigan
LLP which covers the period of February 1, 2016, through February 29, 2016, is hereby
approved for payment by the Retirement Trust.

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized fo submit the invoice for payment

by the Retxremcnt Trust. /VV/

A

ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this lhc@ day of M&Z 2016,

- SPECIAL "CHAN CERY COURT JUDGE

Submitted by: . e ;\l /// s
B Moo

Trustee on behalf of the Singing River Health System "/,( N :ow,‘i"n g

Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust ALY L‘.J%w“

Deutsch Ketrigan, L.L.P. . et

th Qe ite 1 : Attested

2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001 e argina D(énf

Gulfport, MS 39501 . DS 90

T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278 Jooh BIdfidge, Chancery Clerk

ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com aikson Codnty, Ml981'55|PP‘DC
BC LA, &%}www—— e
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Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2540 14th Streel, Suile 1004
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telophone: (228) 864-0161  Fax: (226) B63-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

' involce No: 489502

02424-00001
Involce Date: 03/48/12016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
. 'AN‘DTRU

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

p O BOX 2114
JACKSON, MS 39225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPO!NTMENT

For services rendered for period through 02/29/2016 in connection with:
R_eference No. 02424-00001

Fees $29,450.00

Expenses $0.00
e —

Total Cuyrent Charges $29,450.00

your remittance.

Please reference ouf invoice number with
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
page 1 of 6




Apr. 40 2017 9:27AM

Denham law firm

~ No. 2466 - P 40

Involce No: 480502

02424-00001
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: - 0371812016

professional Services

DATE 1D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT

| 02/01/2016 88§ 1100  Prepara for Special Fiduciary Website development. 4.00 250.00 4,000.00
| A101

: 02/01/2016 s L100 Wabsite creation for Special Fiduciary and beneficiaries. 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A101

02/02/2016 sgs L1120 Rasearch Pension plan early buyout optians. 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102

02/06/2016 sgs  L110 Early buyout of defined benefit healthcare and pensian 8.00 250.00 2,000.00

A02 plana nationwide.

02/08/2016 sps L1100 Research potential restructure of pension plan : 7,00 250.00 1,760.00
A102 investments.

02/10/2016 sps L4130 Review and research Fiduciary Vest investments and 7.40 250.00 1,850.00
A102 fund portfolio.

02/10/2016 ses L1110 Telephone call with Jim Reeves, counsel for Plaintiffs 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 regarding Earl Denham correspondence.

02/10/2016 sps L110 Tolephone call Wwith counsel, Jim Reeves regarding Dec. 0.20 250.00 50.00
At07 b 2016 market value for website publication.

0201002016 SBS  L110 Email to Jim Reeves 0,10 250.00 25.00
A107

02/10/2016 sBs L1110 Review earl denham Letter regarding recusal. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A104

0214112016 SBS Review and research SRHS employee pension plan and 7.20 250.00 1,800.00

A102 trust investment plan restructure potential.

02/11/2016 sgs L100 Review Transamerica invoices for adrin and acluarial 0.50 250.00 125,00
A104 Servises.

|lease reference out invoice number with your remittance.

P
peutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 6



Apr. 4 2017 9:2]AM

02424-00001
SINGING RIVER HEALTH sY
N
02112016 SBS
Af04
02412016  SBS L110
AL07
02M2/2016  SBS
: AID2
02/12/2016  SBS 1130
' A107
o2/43/2016  SBS 1110
A107
02/16/2016  SBS - 1210
A104
02/16/2016  SBS 1110
A107
02/16/2016  SBS L110
A107
02/16/2016  SBS
A102
02/16/2016  SBS L110
A104
o2/46/2016  SBS L110
A105
02/16/2016  SBS L2158
A104
02/16/2016  SBS 1210
A104
o2/16/2016  SBS 1130
A104

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 7585 Magazine gtraet New Orleans, LA 70130

STEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

Denham Taw firm

Telephone call with Lee Bond regarding Transamerica
involces.

Email to Lee Bond with TransAmeflca attachment.
investment plan restructure potential research.

Telephona conference with Morgan Stanley, Mike Dowell
regarding investment plan.

Email from Lee Bond regarding TransAmerica invoice,

Review/ analyze PITITION FOR CITATION FOR
CONTEMPT OF COURT ASTO L.BRELAND HILBURN
AND FOR OTHER RELIEF.

Email from Jim Reeves regarding Denham petition..
Email frdm Leo Bond regarding Rate on investments.

SRHS penslon plan investment reports and from
sawyer investments.

Review email and attachment regarding Chub Fiduciary
Coverage for potential claim for of fiduclary oXpenses.

Enmail from counsel, Charles mikhail regardin Chub
litigation.

Review Motion to dismiss appeal

Review SRHS response to federal insurance O motion
to stay.

Review analyze January Trustmark financial reports from
fund managers : R -

]

Please raference our involce numbef with your ramittance.

No. 2466  P. 41
Involce No: 489502
Involce Date: 03/18/2016
0.30 250.00 75.00
0.10 250.00 25.00
§.80 260.00 1,700.00 -
0.50 250.00 125,00
0.26 250.00 50.00
0.50 250.00 125.00
0.20 250.00 50.00
0.20 250.00 50.00
6.0 250.00 4,725.00
0.80 250.00 200,00
0.10 250.00 25.00
2.00 250.00 500.00
2.00 250.00 500.00
200 250.00 500.00

page 3 of6




Apr. 4. 2017 9:27AM

Denham lav firm

No. 2466 P. 42
02424-00001 Inveice No: 489502
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 03/18/2016
AND TRU

02/17/12016 sBs L1130 Conclude review of trustmark financlal reports for Jan. 2,00 250.00 500.00
02/4712016 sBS 1250 Review and research for response to Motion for 6.50 250.00 1,625.00
A102 contempt.
02/18/2016 sps  L100 Emall to Fiduclary Vest, Jason Small regarding quarterly 0.20 250.00 50.00
A103 pension plan trustee meeting.
02/16/2018 SB8S Continue prepamtion for response to Denham/Barton 2.80 250.00 700.00
A102 motion for recusal.
02/48/2016 sps L2210 Rasearch response to Barton/Denham $.Ct. Motion. 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
' A102
0211912016 S8S Prepare esponse to Denham/ Barton S.Ct, Motions. 4.00 250.00 1,000,00
A102
02/22/2016 gps L1100 6.00 250.00 1,600.00
A102 '
02/23/2016 sBs 1100 Email from I(rissan Dykes, SRHS regarding Trustes 0.20 260.00 50.00
A107 meeting.
02{23/2016 sBs L1110 6.00 250.00 1,500.00
A102
02/2412016 sps L1110 5.00 250.00 1,2560.00
A109
02/25/2016 sps Ul 30 ' 5.00 250,00 1,250.00
A109
02/2612016 sps  Li30 5.00 250.00 1,250.00
A109
02/29/2016 SBS Review email and attachments from Chris Jones. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104 Eastern Timberland Opportynities I, nc.
02/29/2016 sgs L1130 Review revised December Pointer statement, Wedge 1,50 250.00 375.00

A104 Jan 16 Statement and Jan. 2016 Elliott statement from
. Kerry Caldarelll, (B0 *+- pages)

Please reference our invoice number with your yemittance.

Dautsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Sqreet New Orleans, LA 70130

page 4 of 6




A
‘Df. 4. 2017 9:2]AM Denham Taw firm
| | No. 2466 P, 43

489602
03/18/2016

tnvolce No:
involce Date:

02424-00001

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTE RETIREMENT PLAN

M EMPLOYEES'

Fee Total 117.80/hes 29,450.00

' Expenses

pleasa reference our Invoice number with your remittance.
Orleans, LA 70130

nLLe . 758 Magazine Street New

Deutsch Kerrlga
page 5 of 6




Aor. 40 2017 9:27AM  Denham law firm

No. 2466 P 44
02424-00001 Involca No: 489502
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 03/16/2016
AND TRUST
Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rale Amount
STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 117.80 250.00 $29 450.00
Totals 117.80 $29,450.00
Total:Amount Due ofi ifis lnvaice - . . S .$29,460.00
STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Date nvoice Bllled Credite Balance
02/24/2016 488317  $32,001.10 - $0.00 $32,001.10
Total Outstanding Balance $32,001.10

Please refarence our invoice number with your remiftance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 6 of &




Apr. 4. 2017 9:27AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466  P. 45

[N THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI F | LED

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust MAY 20 2015
tal v.Si River Health System, e I.; Cause N 2015-0027  JOS
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, € al.; (-ause BO. By HELDRIDGE, CLERK

Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al. Cause No, 2015-0060 —_—

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore tenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Piduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (ffRetirement Trust”) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 490559 dated April 20, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
which covers the period of March 1, 2016, through March 31, 2016, is hereby approved for.
payment by the Retirement Trust.

2. '. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment

by the Retirement Trust.

/e
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the / / day of /22 % , 2016.

Z
SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT JUDGE
Submitted by: ' ‘maoea,,
Vre‘ \\ NV
1;{,3 tf’ C)"‘ (S .
ot
RN B. SIMPSON (MSB #6809), Special Fiduciary

Trustee on behalf of the Singing River Health System ]
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust e IR
Deutsch ‘Kcrmgan LLP. e Cg\ ;?{e&\gma\ O(@P‘:"-\} \'\"Zm‘"
2510 14" Street, Suite 1001 To be Mm o
Gulfport, MS 39501 Ao e ChamW

T (228) 864-0161, F: (228) 863-5278 MississipP! 0.C
smmpson@dcutschkel rigan.com BY &Qﬁmy, —




Apr. 4 2017 9:27AM  Denham law firm

No. 2466  P. 46
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS- 39501
Telaphone: (226) gs4-0161  Fax: (226) 863-5278
FEIN 72-0929209
invoica Na: 490869

0
Invoice Date: 04/20/2016

2424-00001
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
’A -

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

p O BOX 2114
JACKSON, MS 39225

For services rendered fof period through 03/31/2016 in connection with:

Reference No. 02424-00001
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Fees $47,125.00
Expenses $0.00
Total Current Charges $17,125.00

our involce number with your remittance.

Please veferance
Deulsch Karrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Sireet New Orfeans, LA 70120
page 1 of 4




Apr. 40 2017 9:27AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P. 47

02424-00001 nvoice No: 490659

5INGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN involce Date: 0412012018

Professional Services

DATE D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT

03/01/2016 sps 1100 Review 4th quarter Fiduclary Vest roport for Trustee 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A101 meeting. Sit investment presentation-

03/01/2016 sps  Lit0 Raview correspondence from Jim Reeves,counsel for 0.30 250.00 75.060
A104 plaintiffs, to MS Supreme Court regarding intertocutory
appeal from garton/Denham.

03/02/2016 gps L100 Attend SRHS plan Truslee meeting. Travel lo/from 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A409 Gulfport to Singing river hospital.

03/02/2016 sgs  L100 Prepare for guaderly trustee meeting- comparlson of 3.50 250.00 875.00
A101 porfarmance of Investments with PERS.

03/04/2016 sas  L100 Research plan restructure oplions for defined benefit 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A101 plans.
03/07/2016 ggs L1110 g£mail rasponse to counsel for plaintiffs, Cal Mayo 0.30 250.00 75.00

A107 regarding questions from members.

03/0712016 sps k110 Emall from plan member Donna Broun regarding 0.40 250.00 25.00
A107 guestions.

$3/07/2016 sgs  L130 Review financial statements of fund managers 6.00 250.00 1,500,00
A104
03/09/2016 sps  L100 Review/analyzo SRHS response to Motion to appeal 1.00 250.00 250.00

A104 interlocutory Order-

03/09/2016 ses Review financial fund statements and investment 700 250.00 1,750.00
A104 compliance with ptan-

03/41/2016 sps L1130 Review lengthy financial reports from investment 400 250.00 4,000.00
A104 managers provided by Kerry Caldarelli SRHS

0311412016 sps  L130 Research Cook County . yevision (0 pension plan. .00 250.00 2,000.00
A102

Plaase reference our invaice number with your remiliance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 756 Magazine Gtreet New Orleans, LA 70130

page 2 of 4




Apr. 4. 2017 9:27AM

Denham lay firm

No. 2466 P, 48
02424-00001 invalee Nos 490569
mvoice Date: 04/20/2016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
ZND TRU!

03/16/2016 sps  L130 Emall regarding acluarial meeting with Frank Carbeny. 0.20 250.00 50.00
: A106 Transametica.

02/45/2016 sps U0 Financial data and investment advice . 500 250.00 1,260.00
A104
03/16/2016 sBs  L130 £mail and attachments from Garalyn Davis with ’ 1,00 260.00 250,00
Al04 Fiduciary Vesl regarding investor manager probation :
letters.
03/16/2016 ‘gps  L100 Financlal data and Investment advlce. 4.00 250.00 4,000.00
A104
03/17/2018 sps  L100 investment advise presenlat‘lon and financlal data. 470 250.00 1475.00
A104
03/18/2018 sps  L130 Emall from Fiduclary Vest, Jason Small. 0.10 250.00 25,00 .
A106
03/23/2016 sBs 1130 Review Singing River Heallh System Employee's 2.00 250.00 500.00
A104 Retirement Plan and T yust audit by Dixon Hughes
Goodman LLP.
03/23/2016 s L130 Review SRHS Employee's Retirement Plan and Trust 940 250.00 600.00

A104 financial statements and required supplementary
information associated with audit.

03/25/2016 sps  L130 Review and exacute proxy for annual meeting of 0.40 250.00 100.00
A106 stockhotders of eastern Timberiand Opportunitles i, Inc.
and retuen to Tim Hartigan, managing director.

03/28/2016 apgs w130 Review Feb.Slalemenls from financial advisors 250 250.00 625.00
A104 :

Feo Total 68.50 /hrs 47,125,00

Expenses

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

pautsch Kerrigan LLP - 756 Magazine Stract New Orieans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 4




Apr. 4, .
2017 .9'28AM Denham law firm
' No. 2466 P, 49
Jnvoice No: 450559
involce Date: 04/20/2016

02424-00001
TH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

SINGING RIVER HEAL

Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
s e ——
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON £8.50 250.00 $17,125.00
e
68.50 $17,126.00

Totals

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT -

pale [nvoice Billed Credils Balance
03/18/2016 489502 ‘329,450.00 $0.00 $29 A50.00
T $29,450.00

Total Outstanding Balance

Please reference our invoice numbar with your remittance.
Lp - 7556 Magazine Sireet New Qrleans, LA 70130

Deutscli Kerrigan L
Page 4 of 4




Aor. 4 2017 9:28AM © Denham Taw firm
. No. 2466 P, 50

N'THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, misssseet  FILED

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retivement Plan and Trust JUN 16 2016
Broun, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0027  josH ELDRlDGE CLERK

Lay, etdl. v. Singing River Health Syste, ef al.; Cause No. 20 15-0060 By

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore terms of S;tcphcn B. Simpson, the
Sp;:c;al F;d\;cxm”; for and on behalf of the Singing River Heahb,System,Empjoy;acis,’ﬁ o
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”) for anthority td pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Spcoial Fiduciary fees, and the Court having féyicwed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1.  Invoice No. 493337 dated May 26, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kexrigan LLP
which covers the perjod of April 1, 2016, through April 30, 2016, is heseby approved for

payment by the Retirement Trust,

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to qubmit the invoice for payment
by the Retirement Trust. SR ﬁ |
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the 8 dayof ,2016.

SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT TUDGE

Alleated O@L&\_
To be a |rue copy o otlginal A '

Filed A il/\/f\ﬂ,\il(? 201U -

), Special Fi uciary Josh Eldridge, Chancery Clerk

Truste on behalf of the-Singing River Health System Jagkson Gounty, Mgssissippl .

Employees’ Reticement Plan and Trust By 4 )'\/VU/!§ V] Ce e,
. Doy

Deutsch Kerrigan, LL.2. ztne;\m,{" le, ~

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001 o, hen 90

R s [ AR
Gulfport, MS 39501 RO 0

4

(]

&

Pl

T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278 R b@“ SRS
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com : Rk naes s 2
B R Y
A 1, M R o
Wiv, O ,“”,.‘0 v
s I,{‘yl? D‘\‘\“q\\""\“




Denham law firm

Apr. 40 2017 9:28AM

No. 2466 P, 51
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 44lh Slreat, Sulle 1001
Gulfport, MS 39601
Telaphone: (228) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-6278

FEIN  72-0029299
02424-00001 invoice No: 493337
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN fnvoice Datet 05/26/2016
‘AND -

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
G/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

o *P‘@'BGXQ’,["}‘A[‘:“ e e “ w e
AGKSONMS 86226~~~ T C

‘RE.
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE AF’POINTMENT

For services rendered for petiod through 04/30/2018 In connection with:
Refarence No. 02424-00001 ’

Fees $22,060,00
Expenses : $0.00

e
Total Gurrent Charges $22,060.00

Please referance our invoice number with your ramittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Streat New Orleans, LA70130 -
page 1 of 4




Aor. 4. 2017 9:28AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P. 59

Deutsch Ketrigan LLP
Inquiry Activity Billed Report (4/1/2016 - 4/3012016)

ClentiMatier: 02424 SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST / 02424-00001
Bill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Hours Faes Cagh Exp, Nop-Cash Exp. Digcoupt Tofal
Billed: 88.20 22,050.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 22,060.00
Employge Recap! Hours Fees Cash Exp, Non-Cash Exo. Discount Total

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 88.20 22,050.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 22,050.00




Apr. 4. 2017 9:28AM Denham law firm N
0. 2466 P 53

Ailled Values

Date [kpr/Exp Activity Degcripflon Qty Ratg ADLQH_I‘_{
Time Fees

04/01/2016 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON 800 250.00 2,000.00
Research Barton Denham pleadings.

p4/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 170 250.00 425.00
Particlpate in telephone conf, with Transamerica actuarial meeting et al,

04/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 100 28000 250.00
Review SRHS Retlrement plan 2016 Valuation resulfs for Conf. call with TransAmefica.

04/05/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 6.00 250.00 1,500.00

04/06/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Revlew and research Supreme cour issues.

04/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 900 250,00 2,250.00

04/11/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ‘ 8.00 250.00 2,000.00

Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust “Financial Statements and Required Supplementary information” for year ended
9/30/2015 by Dixon Hughes Goodman, LLP. Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust 8/30 2015 "Report to those Charged with
Governance” by DHG, LLP

04/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON | 120 ?250.00 300.00
Conference call with Morgan stanley,Sage, et al investment advisors

04/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON- 3.00 250.00 750.00
financial report analysis

04/18/2016 0064 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00 250,00 1,000.00
Research Sage fnvestment.

04/19/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 200 25000 500.00
Mesting with counsal, Chatles Makhall, :

04/19/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 200 25000 5600.00
Prepara and obtain documents for meeting with counsel ]

04/1072016 0804 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
Revlew supreme court flling and research on Barton Motlon for expedited proceedings.

04/20/2016 0664 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . : B.o0  250.00 2,000.00
Financial analysis of April repors. ’ .

04/2172016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 340 25000 850.00
review research financial Investor Sage for trust custodianfinvestor.

04/22/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 7.30 250.00 1,825.00
review and research Chub/Federal Insurance coverage issue per counsel advice regarding axpense of trustee.

041252016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 350 26000 B875.00
March financial reports.

04/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 400 25000 1,000.00
Review and analyze SRHS plan and trusl Annual Report for year ending 9/30/2015.

04/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3,00 26000 760.00

Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust agreement "Summary Plan Descripfion.

2/44/2017 2:10 PM Page 2 of 3




Apr. 4. 2017 9:28AM  Denham law firm No. 2466
0. P. H4

Billed Values

Date TkprlExp Acflvity Description Qty Rate Amount
04/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 040 25000  25.00
Emall from counsel, Charles Mikhail regarding recusal of Jackson county Clrcult court judges.

04/29/2016 0884 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 100 250.00 250.00

Review and prepare request for payment of administrative fees to TransAmerica and pravide ta payor.

Totals! 68,20 22,050.00
Report Totals: 22,050.00
Page 30of 3

211472017 210 PM




Apr.

4. 2017 9:28AM Denham law firm No. 2466 - P. 55

IN'THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSPPT [~ ILE D

IN'RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust JUL 14 2016
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.: Cause No. 2015-0027 éOS HELDRIDGE CLERK
y )
Lay, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore ferus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 494379 dated June 30, 2016, submirted by Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
which covers the period of May 1, 2016, through May 31, 2016, is hereby approved for

payment by the Retirement Trust. .

2, The Special Fiduciery is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment
by the Retirement Trust. "
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the || _ day of %é 2016,

R

SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT JUDGE <

Submitted by:

Attested

To be a frug copy of origin
e Filed_ 20
. O MSB %809), SpeClal FldUCIaI')' Josh E'd{- e, Chancery Clerk
tthie Singing River Health System Jackson County, {ssissippi
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust By M4 NICE D,
Deutsch Kerrigan, LL.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501 - T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




A r‘ ) \ . .
or. 4. 2017 9.?8AM‘ Denham law firm No. 2466 P 56
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Slreel, Sulle 1001
Gulfport, MS 39601
Telephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax; (228) B63-5278

FEIN  72-0929290
02424-00001 ’ Invoice No: 494379
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN " Involce Date: 06/30/2016

AND TRUST

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. 1. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE;
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 05/31/2016 in connection with:
Reference No.02424-00001

Fees $26,700.00
Expenses $0.00
Total Current Charges $28,700.00

Please reference our involce number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10f4




Apr. 4. 2017 9:28AM Denham law firm

Inqui

ClientMatter: 02424 SINGING RlVE&H

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
ry Actlvity Billed Report (5/1/2016 - 5/31/2016)

gill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

No. 2466  P. 57

EALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST / 02424-00001

Hours Feos Cash Exp, Non-Cash Exp. pisgount Total

Bitied: 114.80 28,700.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 28,700.00

loyee Re Hours Foas Cash Exp, NonLash Exp, Dlgcount Yotal

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.00 28,700.00

114.80 28,700.00 0.00 0.00




Apr. 4. 2017 9:28AM Denham law firm

Date Tkor/Exp  Actlvity Desatlption
Time Fees

05/02/2016 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Review financial statements from Kery Calderell
05/02/2018 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

plan and prepare for Federal cour faimess hearing testimony.
05/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

research falrmess hearing burden of proof et al.

05/05/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

plan and prepare for Fed. Ct hearing. Plan and trust documents and Ms trust coda documents,

05/06/2018 0884 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON

Email from Jason Small with Fiduciary Vest . review Sit Investmenl Associates portfolio.

05/06/2018 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Eed Ct. classaction certification hearing preparation.
05/09/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Email from Greg Figaro with Sage Investments.
05/09/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Identify and prepare documenls and potential exhibits for faimness hearing.
05/{0/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

prepare for Fed. Court class certification and falmess hearing
0512016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Plan and prepare for Fed. Ct fairness hearing.
05/43/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Meet wilh counsel and prepare for Fad Court class certificallon and falrness hearing.
05/162016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Mest with counse!/ atlend and teslify at fairess federal court hearing.
05/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SMPSON

Telephone call with counsel, Charles Mikhail regarding fairness federal court hearing.
05/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Ptan and prepare outline for RFP for investment management and custodial services
05102016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Plan and prepare RFP for management/investment sepvices,
05/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Continue analysis of fund managers and fees/basis point cost,
05/23/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Email thread from Kerry Calarell ragarding Invoice payments.
05/23/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Prepare oulline for RFP.
05/24/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Email from Jason Small, Flduciary Vest confirming quarterly meeting and agenda,
05/24/2016 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

RFP proposal draft.

21412017 212 PM

No. 2466  P. 58
Bliled Values .
Qty  Rate Amount
4,60 250,00 1,200.00
4,00 260,00 1,000.00
750 250.00 1,875.00
8,00 250,00 2,000.00
150 260.00 375.00
6.60 250.00 1,650.00
020 250.00 » 50.00
700 250.00 1,750.00
8.00 250.00 2,000.00
450 250.00 1,125.00
6.00 250.00 1,500.00
8.00 250.00 2,000.00
020 250.00  50.00
500 250.00 1,250.00
6.00 250.00 1,500.00
B.00 250.00 2,000.00
0.30 250.00 75.00
7.00 250.00 1,750.00
0.20 250.00 50.00
6.00 250.00 1,500.00

Page 2 of 3




Apr. 4. 2017 9:29AM Denham law firm No. 2466 P. 59

Bllled Values
Date TkprExp Activity Deecription , Qly Ratg Amount

05/25/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00

Review and analyze Investmant allocation compliance and performance for quarterly mesting with Fiduclary Vest

05/26/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, 5IMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00

Analysls of Investment managers feos/basis points,invastment performance.

Tofals: 114.80 " 28,700.00
Report Totals: 28,700.00
Page 3 0f 3
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Apr.

4. 2017 9:29AM Denham law firm : No. 2466

IN RE: Sioging River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust ‘
Broun, ef o/, v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No, 2015-0027
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.,; Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on moton ore tenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the

Special Fiduciary for and on behal'f of the Singing River Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (‘;Iictirement Tr'ust”) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges: .

1. Invoice No. 495563 dated July-28, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
which covers the period of June 1, 2016, through. June 30, 2016, is hereby ap'proved for
payment by the Retirement Trust.

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment

by the Retirement Trust,

. A '
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the 2 & day of %;%z/— ,2016.

SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT JUDGRE

Submitted

Trustee on behalf oftthe Singing ver Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust  °

Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501 - T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com

P.

60




Apr. 40 2017 9:29AM  Denham law firm j - No. 2466 P, 61
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Stresl, Suite 1001
Gulfporl, MS 39501
Telephone: (226) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278

FEIN  72-0929299
02424-00001 invoice No: 495562
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 07/28/2016
ARD TRUST

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 06/30/2016 in connectlon with;
Reference No, 02424-00001

Fees $19,375.00
Expenses $0.10
Total Current Charges $19,375.10

Please reference our invoica number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP ~ 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 0of &




Ajpr. 4. 2017 9:29AM  Denham law firm
| - No. 2466 P 62

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
jed Report (6/1/2016 - 6/30/2016)

Inquiry Activity Bil
Client’/Matter: 02424 SINGING RIVE_R_!jE_ALTE?YS_TEM E_MPLQ_Y#E_ESLISE;T@EMENT PLAN AND TRUST { 02424-00001
gill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Hours Fees  Cash P Non-Cash Exp. Disgount Tota]
Bliled: 77.50 19,375.00 0.00 0.10 0.00 19,375.10
Employes Recap: Hours Faeg Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. D]scount Total
0.10 0.00 19,376.10

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 77.50 19,376.00 0.00




Denham law firm

Apr. 4 2017 9:29AM

No. 2466 P,

63

Bliled Values

- pata Thpr/Exn  Activity Deseription Qty  Rate Amount
Time Foes

o0s/01/2018 0064 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' 400 250.00 1,000.00
Travel to/from Gulfport o Singing river hospital and altond quarterly plan and trust trustee meeting

08/02/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 100 25000 250.00
Review Opinion and Order Granting Motion for final Approval of Settlament.

06/03/2016 0864 ST EPHEN B. SIMPSON gO0 250,00 2,000.00
Reviow asset allocatlon for polential change recommendation of eliminating or reducing Allernalives

08/07/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON - 100 25000 250.00
Recelve and review SRHS Proposel for freeze calculations from Kim Langlois @ Transamefica

06/07/2018 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3,70 250.00 925.00
Allocation of assets and plan amendment options

06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.00 25000 25000
Receive and review CAPITAL CALL NOTICE, regarding Invesco Morigage Recovery Loans Feeder Fund.L.P,
and execule paymant authoriztion,

08/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . 100 25000 250.00
Conference call with Frank Garberry, Traneamefica Lee Bond, SRHS;etal B

08062016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' 030 25000  75.00
Recelve and review lelter 10 Bradford 8 Marzec probation notice.

06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 460 250.00 1,150.00
Plan modification by RFP

06/13/2016 0864 STEPHENB. SIMPSON 700 250.00 1,750.00
Raceivelreview invesiment recommendalion from Fiduciary Vest, Sit Invastments, Mat Wes!, Vanguard, et al

06/13/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.50 25000 125.00
Emall from Lee Bond regarding 6/8 call follow-up; and recommendations

06/14/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 580 250.00 1,450.00
rastructuring models:retirement age; cola, interest rates, return on investmants, etc.

06/15/2016 D864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 200 25000 600,00
Travel to biloxi/return and atlend meeting with Billy Gulee and Brill Singeltary regarding plan and trust progress.

06/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 020 25000 5000
Email thread from Greg Flgaro and Michae) Dowell from Morgan Stanley-

06/2212016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.20 250.00 50,00
Telephone call with class counsel, Jim Reeves

06/22/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 150 250.00 376.00
Mesting with investment advisor Crea Canlrell, Edward Jones,

06/22/2016 08064 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON 700 25000 1,750.00
Plan and prepare amendments and restructure of plan options.

06/23/2016 0B&4 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
Preparafion and plan RFP conlents for amendments and restructure Plan

06/24/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00

Conlinue evaluation of REP for restructuring and amendmenlts to Plan.

21412017 212 PM Page 2 of 3




Ao, 4 2017 9:29AM

Denham law firm

Date TkpdExp Agtivity Description
08/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Plan modification RFP research
06/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Meating with counsel, Charles Makhail.
06/29/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

telephone call with class counzel, Jim Reeves.
06/29/2016 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON

Telephone call with Jim Reeves.
06/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Emalllattachment from Jim Reoves, Lucy Tufts and Carley regarding payment of atly fees.

08/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Telephone call from plan beneficiary, Shotlander regarding rotirament,
06/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Receivelraview SRHS pension plan investment report from Aetos Capital.
06/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Research pefined benefit Modification options;cook county/ state of illinols case et al

Expenses

06/29/2016 E101
Copying

214412017 2:12PM

No. 2466 P. ¢
Qty Rate Amoun{
460 250,00 1,450.00
1.00 250.00 260.00
020 250,00 50.00
0.0 260.00 25.00
050 260.00 125.00
020 25000 60,00
100 250.00 250,00
6510  250.00 1,275.00

Totals: 77.60

1.00

Totals: 1.00

Report Totals:

19,375.00
0.10 0.10

0.10
19,375.10

page 3 of 3




Apr. 40 2017 9:29AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P. 65

N THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI F I L E D

(\\S%P 08 2016
e

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust
Brou, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0027 8
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cange No, 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FXDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore fenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System Employees’
Retirementi Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust™) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’S
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Tnvoice No. 496992 dated August 23, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of July 1, 2016, through July 31, 2016, is hereby approved for
payment by the Retirement Trust.

2. The Speeial Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment

by the Retirement Trust,

SIS P
ORDERED AND ADIJUDGED this the % day of ~ ~,2016.
e /\
SPECIAL%%NCERY COURT JUDGE ~—

Submitted by:

rustee n bcbalf of the-Sinfi

Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust

Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501 - T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@dentschkerrigan.com




Aor. 40 2017 9:29AM  Denham law firm:

No. 2466  P. 66
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 30501
Telophone: (228) 864-0161 Fax: (220)863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299
02424-00001 invoice No: 496992

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 08/25/2016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: .
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 07/31/2016 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $14,350.00
Expenses ) $59.42

e
Total Current Charges $14,409.42

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP « 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA T0130

Page 1 of 6




Apr. 4 2017 9:29AM  Denham law firm

No. 2466 P. 67
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161 Fax: (228) 863-5278

FEIN  72-0920299
02424-00001 Invoice No: 496992
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 08/25/2016

AND TRUST

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: . :
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 07/31/2016 in connection with;
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $14,350.00
Expensss $59.42
Total Current Charges $14,409.42

_ Plaase reference our invoice number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 of 6
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No. 2466 P 68
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suita 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 884-0161  FaX: (228) 863-56278

FEIN  72-0929299
IS R —
02424-00001 Inveice Na: 496992
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 008/25/2016

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39226

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for perlod through 07/31/2016 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $14,350,00
Expenses ' $69.42

[
Total Current Charges $14,409.42

Please reference our invoice numbar with your remittance.

peutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 of 6




Aor. 4 2017 9:29AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P 69
02424-00001 involce No: 496092
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 0812512016
AND TRUST
Professional Services
DATE ID DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE  AMOUNT
07/01/2016 SBS 1110 Emall thread with Cal Mayo and Charles Malchail, 0.10 250.00 25.00
A104
07/01/2016 SBS L110  Email from Donna Broun. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A104
07/01/2018 sps  L100  Email from Charles Makhall. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A105
07/04/2016 SBS 1100  Review financlal records and retirement plan potential 3.50 2560.00 875.00
A104  Pplan amendments.
07/05/2016 SBS Email thread with Counsel, Charles Makhail and Cal 0.30 250.00 76.00
At04  Mayo.
07/05/2016 58S Emails and agreements between Lee Bond, Marty 0.80 250.00 200.00
A104 Moderson, et al.
07/05/2016 SBS 1130  Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding 1,00 250.00 250.00
AfQ9  pension plan investment opportunity. )
07/06/2016 SBS L1100  Readireview amail from counsel,Charles Makhalil. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A107
07/06/2016 spS L1100  Email thread with counsel, Charles makhall and cal 0.10 250.00 25.00
Al07  Mayo :
07/06/2016 SBS L130  Review Monthly Investor Statement for 6/30/2016 from 0,50 250.00 125.00
A04  Barrow Hanley
07/06/2016 sps 1130 yesearch potential amendments to investment plan 2.80 250.00 700,00
A102
07/07/2016 spS L1130  Attend mesting with Hancock Bank lrust officials 1.50 250.00 375.00
Alg9  regarding custodial and investment opportunities.

Deutsch Karrdgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orl

Pleasa reference our invoice number with your remittance,

eans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 6




Aor. 40 2017 9:30AM Denham law firm

No. 2466 P, 70
02424-00001 o Invoice No: 496992
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 00/25/2016
07/07/2016 SBS Emall from counsel, Carly Duvall with attachment 0.50 250.00 125,00
A104 ragarding amendment to Alty. fees.
07/07/2018 sBS L130  research and investigate investment policy amendments, 6.00 250.00 1,600.00
Af02
07/08/2016 SpS 1130  investment policy and plan amendments. 6.00 250.00 2,000.00
A02
07/18/2016 SBS L1130  Review June 2016 mark to market report. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104
07/18/2016 SBS L1130  Emalt June mark to market report to Billy Guice. 0.10 250.00 25,00
' A107
07/18/2016 SBS 7/11 email from Carly Duvall regarding payment of fees 0.40 250.00 100.00
A104
07/18/2016  SBS 7111 email from Lea Bond with atlachment. 0.50 250.00 125.00
A104
07/18/2016 SpS L1110  7/12lefter from Chubb. 0.40 250.00 100.00
A104
07/18/2016 sSBS 7112 email from Carly Duvall 0.10 250.00 25.00
A104
07/16/2016 SBS 7113 email from Tony Frey @ Hancock Bank regarding 0.30 250.00 75.00
Al04 Investment services.
07/18/2016 SBS Emall from counsel(Kathy Swift) @ Jim Reeves with 0.40 250.00 100.00
’ Af04 attachment.- .
07/18/2016 GBS L1100 Email from Cal Mayo regarding amended atly. fees, 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107
07/18/2016 sgs 1130  review Mark to market report from Garalyn Davis 0.50 250.00 125,00
A104
07/18/2016 sps 1130  Emallwith attachment from Tim Hartigan regarding ETO 0.50 250.00 125.00
A104 il fund

—_—

Please reference our invaice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 155 Magazine Streot New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 6




Apr. 4. 2017 9:30AM . Denham law firm

No. 2466 P 71
02424-00001 . o S involce No: 496992
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 08/25/2016
AND TRUST
07/18/2016 SBS L130  Email with attachments from Garalyn Davis regarding 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104 ETO Il drawdown notice
07/18/2016 8BS 1130 Emall from Joey Beattle @ Stewarl Sneed Hewes 1.00 250,00 250.00
A104 regarding renewal of fiduciary pollcy with attachment.
07/19/2016 SBS L110  Revlew invastment policy and plan potential 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A103 amendments and research health care definad benefit
plans.
07/20/12016 SBS U130  Telephone conference with Mike Dowell, Morgan Stanley 0.50 250.00 125.00
A107 regarding investment opportunity.
07/20/2018 SAS 0130 Review Barrow, Hanley, Mewhinney & Strauss, Large 2.00 250.00 500.00
A104 Cap Value Fund 2018 quarterly reports,
07/20/2016 SBS L‘lO‘O Email requesting appointment with counsel, Charles 0.10 250.00 25.00
A106 Makhail.
07/20/2016 sBS Email from counsel regarding Chubb 0.20 250.00 50.00
A104
07/20/2018 SBS Email from Kerry Caldarelli 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104
07/202016 SBS L1130  Review financial investment reports ' 5,30 250.00 1,326.,00
A104 '
07/21/2016 gBS 100  Email from counsel, charles makhail regarding Cal Mayo 0.20 250.00 50.00
A106
07212016 SBS 1130  Review investment funds and fund manegers to amend 6.80 250.00 4,700.00
A104 ’ pO“CY"" s R . B
07/22/2016 sBS$  L130  Continue fund manager review and asset allocation. 3.560 250.00 875.00
A104
Fee Total 57.40/hrs 14,350.00

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orlean

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

s, LA 70130

Page 4 of 6
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2424-00001

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P, 72

invoice Na: 496992
Invoice Date: D8126/2016

0
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

DATE
07/14/2016

07/22/2016

Expenses
DESCRIPT!ON UNITS RATE AMOUNT
Out-of-town travel TRAVEL TO JACKSON COUNTY 73 054 39.42
GOURT HOUSE FOR FILING ORDER (73 MILES) ,
Other SETTLEMENT FUNDS SHORT $20 DUE TO 20.00
INTERNATIONAL WIRE FEE

02424-001
Expense Total 59.42

remittance,

please reference our involce number with you¥

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 5 of 6




Aor. 4. 2017 9:30AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P
: 0. .13

02424-00001 Invoice No: 496992
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoica Date: 08/25/2016
ANDTRUS]
Timekaeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 57.40 250.00 $14,350.00
A A
Totals 57.40 $14,360.00

T = P AR POA AL T e Y
B | .“) M T WS e &) zﬂé“
Totakh mou “"Bv‘!a%‘%l!}""\l R e e

NE

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

Billed Credits
$0.00 $19,375.10

$19,375.10

_Balance

Date , Involce
495563 $19,375.10
Total Outstanding Balance

07/26/2016

Please reference our Involce number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Straet New Orleans, LA 70130
Page 6 of 6




Apr. 40 2017 9:30AM  Denham lav firm No. 2466
. 0.

Attachments for Bill 496992
Expense: E110 07/14/2016 20160720 _1318468_0001

DS Expenss Relmbursemant / Check Request Form ‘
N Jdvly 16, 2016
Hame Ao Pakot -
EmplayoalTIC Mumber pag
Bend Chedh o Androa Pasker -
T P18 R

Expomae Teea. :
® Ciant Liflablo axporsd O Check - Request fim {o pay vardor

Ofknwmk-umﬂ sxpanse

@ Relmb! 1 - Requoat 1l
Huol yous havw patd

Ordor e v/.w-‘w:wrl

v gt . <
Gibonns . ROVIER TEm s 7 é“f&ft ziliiu:aj:w'mfwm?u\:
5 CERE
JuL 15 2018

P

14




Apr

4. 2017 9:30AM Denham law firm

Expense

V-

Altachments for Bill 496992
1 E124 07/22/2016 20160722_091815_0002

No. 2466

Holland, Shefly

From: Chesty, Damrell K,

Sent: Thursdsy, July 23, 2016 243
To: HoWand, Shelly

Subjects Re Yrust check

Yes, and hill It to the fite

L

From; Holland, Shelly

erveams ey e % s e g e eSS A e s

Sents Thursday, July 21, 2016 12:42 PM
To: Cherry, Darrell K,; Davis, Lore

Subfect: Trust check

pamrell, a $20 Intarnational wira fee was deducted from the wire —vo tha totel amount s $12,480,00 In trust, Da you
want ma ta have Chrls cut an operating chack for §20 and depasit Into brust to make It an even 12,500,007 Also, the
iame in Coyota is Kimball sed your note 2ays Kimble. Can you conflim which lsthe corract spelling?

Thanks,
Shelly

P.

15




Aor. 4 2017 9:30AM  Denham law firm No. 2466
0.

Attachments for Bill 496992
Expense: E124 07/22/201 6 20160722_09181 §_0001

——e—
DKS Expense Relmbursement | Check Request Form
Juiy 22, 2016
Nama Shetty Hollapd
Employee/TK Nusitber 285
Send Cheek to Shelly Hollard
Erpopne Type Reguesi Typo )
® Chient blliable oxpenze @ Cheek - Requeat fum 10 pay vendor
OFanFisesions) exp O Rekmburseimon - Requeal oimburgament for conts
{hat you have pald

oRl]| Settiemend Funds shor $20 dve to Inlemationzlwire fee
5§t 02424-00001 .

GHEGH WILL BE BENT TO: Sihedy Holtaod

Note:
Req ""W’,_’ﬁl‘u)’/ Da(e:_l‘ll-’/(i
Agproved BY: Dot
Fof Acalinfing Uee Only
Hatterll, Timofieennt Qﬁ_‘ Date Ameunt Deseiotion
02424-00001 pKG /16T E1Z4 TnR0e 2000 s'gdlrnmwn&: ahort $20 duen to ntermagonal
V242400001
Chris | plense HECEIVEL
. wele  ASAP. n L 27 208 D
AV . o : Y R = —
/Illnwffs,

16




Apr.

Lay, et al V. singing R

4. 2017 9:30AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P, 77

FILED

[N THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPL Pnkg 13 ?017

QX

. , CLERK
IN RE: singing River Health System Employees‘ Retirement Plan and Trust

Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Causs No. 2014-2653
Thompson, etal. v. singing River Health System, et al,; Cause Na. 2014-2695
gosarge, etal- V- singing River Health System, at al.; Cause No. 2014-2729
Aguillar, etal, V. singing River Health System, ot al.; Cause No. 2014.27 53
prury, et al. V. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al CaUse No. 2015-0027
Eiland, et al. V. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0030 °

jver Health System, et al; Gause No. 2015-0060

AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEE§

ORDER
pecial

THIS CASE came pefore the Court on motion of Stephen B. Simpson, the S

Flduciary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement
plan and Trust ("Trust“) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP's Involce for Speclal
Fiduclary fees. The motion was heard in open court on January 14, 2017, The Specisl
Fiduclary descrlbad hus duties and {estified concerming his bilt,

Based upon| the teshmony and representat\ons of counsel at the heaﬁng. khe Court‘

finds that the gpeclal FI Fiduciary assumed his duties In October of 2015, The funds of the

Trust wers investad with 35 different fund managers. The duties of the Special Fiduclary
include maneging the 35 Trust fund managers. He terminated at teast one fund manager
for underpetformance and has amended tha terms of the Trustto allow the Trust 1o more
readily move assets out of underperform\ng investments. He racoverad over $300,000

for the Trust and has made other claims on behalf of the Trust that may resultin additional
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funds for the Trust. As of September 30, 2018, the Trust had assets of just over $130
milllon, Direct costto the fund for the year ending september 30 Were approximately $1.8
millon.  Mr. Simpson was askad how much of the direct cost was attributed to his feos.
He testified that he did not review the statements already approved by the Court
immediately prior to the hearing, but his best estimate was that his fees accounted for
approx‘lmately $200,000 of the diract cost- He pointed out that the amount he recovered
for the Trust exceads the amount he has been pald by the Trust.

Mr, Simpson resilfied that the Trust earned 7 8% gross, 6.6% net of direct cost
during the year, and that it paid penefits 1o retiraes. This indicates that the direct cost

was about 19 of the Trust assets. Itwad pointed out that 1% is not an uncommon fee

for the administration and other direct cOstS of many investmant funds such as mutual
funds. However gxhibit 1 In the hearing an the motion shows that the direct cost was
1.30% of the geptember Trust fund balence of $130 milllon. Apparently. this difference
{a due to the dechine of the Trust balancé during the year a3 retiree benefits aré patd,
causing the direct cost percentage {o increase in proportion 1o the Trust fund balance.
Addidonally, this fund is encumbered with intensé fivgation, causing expenses nof
encountered by {he average Investrnent fund.

e """’M'r.‘"Simﬁ';’s"dh"té'stméd "that'hﬁ"sp‘ent'79:9 hours ‘performing’ hls-dutles i’ August.
Tha Court prav\ously approved an hourly rate of $250 for his sorvices. His bilt for the
month of August ls $19,975. Mr. 'Slmpson testified that his August piit was higher than
the average blll because he had o run varous models (0 determine the jmpact on the

Trust of amending the Trust plan to change asset allocations, and he had 1o review

pUMerous financlal statements o prepare for upcoming quarterly maetings. The Court
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notes that Mr. Simpson spent the greater part of ¢ix days reviewing financial statements.
The Court finds that Mr, Simpson's WOrk was necessary. Considering the recovery made
by the épet:\al Fiduciary on baehalf of the Trust, the percentage of divect cost to the Trust
fund balance, the portion of direct cost rapresentad by {he faes of the Special Fiduclary
and ﬂ'we; addittonal ime burden of fitigation, the Court finds that the charge Is reasonable.
Therefore, involce number 408014 dated September 26, 2016, gubmitted by
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP which covers the period of August 1, 2016_ through August 31,
2016, In tha amount of §19,975 1s hereby approved for payment by the Trust and the
Spegial Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the lnvaice for payment by the Trust.
The Court recognizes hat it Is not economically fensible or administratively

feasibla to have a monthly hearing to determine the reasonable and necassary fees for

the Speclai Fiduciary. The Court “therefora Insfitutes a system for the efflcient
consideration of {he involces of the Special Fiduclary. Administrative cos__t should be no
more.than reasonably necessary to properly manage the Trust's funds. Courts are not
generally aquipped 1o determine the reasonable cost of administering a $130 milllon
“frust. Therefore, the Court will employ the existing litigation to asslist in determining
appropriate administrativo expenses going forward. The Court recognizes that this is not
-t il éal WY R N GIREY st HEwever, this” 1§ ot a nonmal gt The Coult""""“"
balieves that competent counsel seeking the best mterast of his or her cllenls when -
provided with appropriate information will advise the Court of any perceived |ssues with:
invoices. Additionally, competent, informed counsel representing tha best Interest of thelr
clents will be motivated to suggest cost saving measures | and efficlencles that may not

otherwlise be apparent.
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Therefore, the Special Fiduciary shall submlt gl future requests for payment of
foes and axpenses to the Court by fillng a mofion with the Cletlg, with detalied involces
attached. Goind farward, the Court wishes to have greater detail ihan that which was
provided In the August Invoice. Greater detall may reduce the nacessity of a hearing. A
copy of the motion and invoice(s) shall be provided to the following counsel far Plalmiffs:
Jim Reeves, Cal Mayo, Earl Denham, and Harvey parton. A copy ghall also be provided
to Breft Willlams, counsel for Singing River Hospltal, urdil further order of the Court. Any
objection to Mr. simpson's bil poust be in writing, filed with the Court within 7. days of
receipt of the bill with a copy of the objection to all counsel, 1fno objection I8 racelved

within 7 days, fhe Court will assume {hat there ls no objection to the nvoice. Any

response 10 objection ghall be In writing, filed wi\hin 7 days of receipt of the objection.
The Courtwil rule on each request for payment after considering alltimely objections and
fesponses. The court administrator will schedule a hearing If the Court believes one 18
necessary or helpful after considering the motion and any timely oblection and response.

Counsel for some of the Plaintiffs asserted at the hearing that they had ndt recelved
a copy'of previous Involcas submitted to the Court by Mr, Slmpson. Counsel for the
Special Fiduciary polnted out that no duty to submit the Invoices 10 counsel was imposed

e \‘jp'oh"ihe"Speclal‘ Flduclary"elthor'by"prev‘loua‘ordemf'the"'Gourt'or under the-dutles " .-

jmposed upon trustees by taw. That Is true. However, this Is no ordinary trust aﬁd this Is
no ordinary trustee.

The previous management of this Trust by previous trustees ls the subject of
intense {iigation. As a consequence of the alleged failures of the previous trustees, In

9046 the Court replaced those frustees with a Court appointed Speclal Fiduclary.
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The Court is interested in providing an appropriate degree of transparency of the
management of tha Trust by the Court's appointed Speclal Fiduciary. The Court
commends the Special Fiduciary for his efforts on pbehalf of the Trust and his commitment
to place future quarterly raports onthe webslte so that retirees and other interested parties
can obtain imporiant (nformation about the Trust.

n addiﬂon, Mr. Bimpson shall immediately provida to each of the aforementioned
counsel a full copy of aach quartery report for each quarter that he has served 85 Special
Fiduciary and shall provide a copy of sach future quarterly report to the aforemantloned
counsel as soon as itis avallable to him. Mr. Simpson shall \mmedia\é\y provide to each
of the aforementioned counsel a copy of each bill previousty submitted to and approved

by the Gourt.

50 ORDERED thls the 3 sa A 2017,
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Deutsch Kerrigah LLP
2610 14th gireet, Sulle 1001
Guifport, M8 39601

elophonat (226) 864-0161 Fax (220)8636279
FEN 720920290

498044

Involce Noi
09/26/2016

nvoloe Datei

OYEEE' RET!REMENT PLAN

07474-00004
gINGING RIVER

N

HEALTH gyYSTEM EMPL

PLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST

GYSTEM EM
ted Judge

SINGING RIVER HEALTH
D.Bell, Spaclal Appoln

clo The Honorable James
118 S. State street
Jacksgon, MS 39201~4417

£ APPOINTMENT

RE:
SPECIAL EIDUGIARY TRUSTE
rough 08/31/2018 in conn

rvices rendered for period th
02424-00001

action with!

For s@l
Refarence No.

Fo&s . $16,876.00
$0.00
$1 9.975.00

Expenass
Total Gurrant Charges

amlitanoe.

Plaave raforence our Involee aumber with youv 4
7ine Straat New oneans, LA 70430

Deutssh Kertlgan P - 756 Mada
page 1 of 4
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SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLO

DATE D
08/0422016  SBS
A104
oposi2016  SBS 130
A104
opizi2016  SBS  Li30
A107
op/i2/2016  5BS  L1%0
A104
' ogfi52016  SBS  L130
' A102
0b/6/2016  SBS 1130
A102
oai7i20te  SBS 130
MO02
opMe/2016 8BS L130
A0
oaHo016  SBS  L130
A102
og2i0i6  5BS  L100
AOT
oai2zn0le  SBS 130
A104
oap22016  SBS 1100
AL07
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Involce No:

YEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

Involca Date:

Professional Services

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE

Confinue plan amendment rasearch and impact on assel 8.00 260.00

allacation

Contine plan amendment rasearch.and model varlables. $.00 250.00

Emall from Kerry GCaldaretli with financial slatements. 0.10 250.00

Review financial statomants(16) 5.00 250,00
7,00 260.00
7.00 260.00
7.00 250.00
7.00 250.00
7.00 250.00

Emall to Bllly Guice 0.10 260.00

Review July Mark o market report. 0.50- 250.00

Telephone message joft with Kevin Holland requesting 0.40 250.00

meeting.

Please raference our Javoice humber with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 785 Magazine gSireet New Orleans, LA 70130

4968014
09/26/2016

AMOUNT
2,000.00

2,000.00

25.00

1,475.00

4,750.00

1,760.00

1,750.00

1,750.00

1,750.00

26.00

426.00

25.00

Page 2 0f4
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£ 02424,00001 invoice Nei 498014
GINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 09/26/2016

00/22/2016 © gBs 1100 Telephone call with Lee Bond discussing model run and 0,20 250.00 £0.00
AO7 selting meeling.

08/22/2016 gas L1130 Review and analyze Model run from Frank Carberry. ' 2,00 250.00 500.00
; A104 TransAmerica

08/22/2016 sps L1110 Telephone call with Marly Moderson 0.20 250.00 £60.00
A104 '

0812212016 sBs 1100 Telephone,call to Marty Modarson. 0.20 250.00 50,00
A107

08/24/2016 sps L1130 Prepare for meeling with Lee Bond and Kevin Holland 3.50 250.00 875.00

' A101 regarding pension plan model and benefil analysis and
performance.
06/26/2016 sps  L110 Altond meating at SRHS with Lee Bond and Kevin 2.00 250.00 500,00

A1 00 Hol\ﬂnd

08/25/2016 sps 1130 Review and research TransAmerica Model and adjust 340 260.00 775.00
A101 variables and plan modifications. ’

08252018 ges L130 Roview email from counsel, Charles Makhail and 2.80 260,00 700.00
AO7 attached Hancock Bank e6CTOW agreement.

opl26/2016  SBS Review Trust plan documents and research potentlal 500 26000  2.000.00
A0 amendments yegarding Increase in age of retlrement,
cola, foc,
00/26/2016 sps L1100 Roview lotter from counse), Frad Feeney to Judge Bell 0.20 250.00 §0.00

A104 with attachment..20

Fee Total 79.90 s 19,975.00

Expenses

Please referance our Invaice number with your remittance,

peutseh Kerrdgan LLp- 785 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 4
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0
v

.\)2424:',10001 Involce Na: 498014

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involos Date: 0912612016

Timekeepeor Summary
Timekaeper Name Hours Rale Amount
e AR e ey ———
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 79.00 250.00 $19,075.00
Totals 79.90 $19,876.00

et

ibléiféi‘fiéfdd'@&eféiﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁié155?5’3‘3‘53 AR

-

gTATEMENT OF AGCOUNT
Date Involce Billed Credils Balance
,_.f—'—’_'— e _.—4—'—‘_H e — " _’_'_,_,._’—‘
Tolal Outstanding Balance . $0,00

e
please referencé our involce number with your remittance.

Dautsch Kerrlgan 11p - 755 Magazine Street New Oneans, LA70% 30
page 4 of 4
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COUNTY, MIS SISSIPPI

IN THR CHANCERY COURT OF JACKS ON

ging River Health System
Singing River Health System, ef
Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 20

Fmployees’ Retirement Plan and Trost

N RE: Sin
al., Cause No. 2015-0027

Broun, et al. V.
15-0060

Lay, ef dl. V. ginging Rivet

onsidered the statement of Charles 3. Milchail for lagal servioes

The cmirt examined and ¢
of $3,600.00, dated October 1

8, 2016, providﬁd to sind on behalf of the coutt~

in the total snm
jn the captioped cavses.

on, that such fees were reasonable

-
1 sum of $3,600,00.

appointed Special Fiduciary
o court finds, and is of the op: and necessary and
at to Charles J. Mikhail in the tota

2016.

Th

hereby appoves payme
g0 ORDERED, this day of ,

TON JAMES D, BELL _
Y COURT JUDGE

SEBCIAL CHANCER

86
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Mikhail Law Offices
297 Magnolia Drive South, Suite A
P.0, Box 38
Wiggins, MS 39577
Telephone: 601-928-2050 » Fax; 601-928-2962
Bmail: charles@mlawoffices.net ¢ Website: mlawoffices.net
Chales ], Mikhail* Natalie M. Nasrallah
Lee B. Young** Senjor Research Analyst
- Ootober 18,2016
STATEMENT FOR. LEGAL SERVICES
(Counsel fox Court-Appoinfed Special Tiduciary Stephen B. Simpsont
in Singing River Hospital System Lifigation)
Charles T Milhail
Tax ID Numbey; 27-4409790
0/1/16  Reviewed Carly Duvall's emall and bank esexow agrecment 0.5
Reviewed Jim Reeves's email ro conference, Judge
Singletary and Carly Duvall emalls, and Cal Mayo 0.5
9/2/16 Reviewed Carly Duvall's follow-up email and correoted
escrow agreeroent ' . 0.6
TC with client se Cal Mayo and statos meeting with Jim
_____________________________________ REGYES o = rmmmrmim miipem s et s = D X, SO
- = - Dpafted response-enmail-to Jim Recves and Carly Duvall 0.2
Reviewed emeil from Carly Duvall s conference 0
Roviewed Jim Reaves's email to Carly Duvall 0.1
9/6/16 Reviewed Supreme Coutt otder in Almond v. SRHS 02
Drafied email to client re Supreme Court order 0.1
Reviewed final bank escrow agreement and emailed same
to client 0.6
TC with elient ro Supreme Court ordet and status meeting
apenda 0.2
2 TCs with client ¢ escrow agreement, 03

*Als0 Licensed in Wisconsin
«“Of Coungel

81
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9/7/16

9/8/16

5/9116

9/12/16

9/13/16

9/14/16

9/20/16

~9R116- -

9/22/16

9/28/16

Bmail exchange with Carly Duvall re escrow agrecimont
revisions :

Emails to ellent and Carly Duvall te revisions to escrow

.agreement

Email exchange with Caly Puvall re execution of final
draft of escrow agreement

Reviowed 2 emails from Carly Duvall re the Plan's tax ID
pumber and forwarded same with emall to client; and
emailed to Carly Duvall re tax ID letter

Esmail to Catly Duvall xe bank deposit of fands and emailed
to Carly Duvall re same '
Reviewed Jetiex from Dan Webb and studied case
authorities in 5th cirouit appeal and law Journal atticle re
veservation of rights and coverage, and emailed response to
Dan Webb _

Reviewed Carly Duvall pmail re deposited fands and
response email

Reviewed Cal May epall to Supteme Court

TC with Matthew Mestayet e Judge Hilburn and Britt
Singletary recusals

Reviewed Jim Reeves's letter 1e Tudge Hilbuen recusal
Reviewsd Supreme Court opinion and order

TC with Matthew Mestayer te status aftet recusal
Revicwed Dogan and Wilkinson letter to the Suprowe Cowt
TC with the chancery elerkro motion-and ordex for fees and
emailed client to oxders on fees

Reviowed email from Dan Webb re Chubb and responded
to omail

~Reviewed-Jim Reeves's email re consolidation in the 5th

circuit appeal and reviesred Dan Webb's response

Drafted lettor in response to Chubb's July 8 letter and
emailed draft to chient

Reviewed client email re draft letter to Chubb and drafted
tesponse email

Reviewed Dan Webb email to plaintiff's re consolidation
language In 5th cixeuit appeal

Finalized draft of lettox fo Chubb

Reviewed email from Dan Webb and ordex of the 5th eircuit

0.8

0.4

04

0.8

04

2.0

0.2
0.2

04

0.4
0.2
0.3
02

0.4

0.5

0.6

0.2

0.3
0.2
03

No. 2466

P,

88
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10/3/16

10/4/16

10/5/16

10/6/16

TC with chancery cfesk rc ordex substituting jndge, emailed
client, Jim Reeves and Matthew Mestayet te substitution

Reviewed Chubb's response letter and drafted email to
client re sane

TC with client e Supreme Court ordets on Almond motions
ro Tudge Hilbun and Britt Singletary

Reviewed Supreme Court order on motion fox permission fo
appeal and expedite appeal and TC with Matthew Mestayex
16 game

TC with Jim Reeves t¢ statutes of limitation re KPMG,
Chubb, Transamerica, and agenda for strategy meeting
16 $225=

TOTAL DUL =

Please malee checlk payable to Chatles J, Milchall
(Tax ID Number: 27-4409790)

No. 2466

0.4
0.5

0.2

0.5
0.6
$3,600.00

$3,600.00

89
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IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI
IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement Plen and Trust

Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2614—2653
Thompson, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Canse No, 2014-2695
Bosarge, et al. V. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 20142729
Agillar, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, er al.; Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0027
Eiland, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0030

Lay, etal. V. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

THE, SPECIAL FIDUCIARY’S MOTION FOR

APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF HIS FEES AND EXPENSES

Stephen B. Simpson, Special Fiduciary in the captioned causes of action, moves the court
for entry of an order approving payment of his fees, and in support thereof would show the court
the following: |

1. The Special Fiduciary has performed reasonable and necessary services in
connection with the ac}:rrljnigt;gt_i_pr}_(_)f the Singing River Health System Employees’ vRetiremcnt
Plan and Trust (“Plan and Trust”) and the pcndir;g litig.z-xtién félat'mg thereto, as reflected in the -
invoice for services yendered for the period of time September 1, 2016, through September 30,
2016, attached hereto as Exhibit A.

Wherefore, premises considered, the Special Fiduciary prays that upon review and

consideration of this motion and supporting exhibit, and any objections to the motion and replies

to those objections, the court enter an order finding that the services of the Special Fiduciary as

P 90
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reflected in the invoice attached as Exhibit A are reasonable and necessary, and approving

payment of this invoice,

Respectfully submitted, this 6 day of Pebruary, 2017.

Stephen B. Simpson (MS Bar No. 6809)
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

Telephone: (228) 864-0161

Facsimile: (228) 863-5278

Special Fiduciary

P.

91




Aoro 4 2017 9:32AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P. 9)

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
I, the undersigned counsel certifies that he bas this day served a copy of the foregoing
Special Fiduciary’s Motion for Approval and Payment of His Fees and Expenses by electronic
mail on the following:
Harvey Barton, Esq.
Earl Denham, Esq.
Cal Mayo, Esq.

Tim Reeves, Esq.

Brett Williams, Esq.

This _[6‘ day of February, 2017.
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Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Streel, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 38501
Telephone: (228) aea-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278
FEIN 72-0929299
tnvoice No: 489363.1
Invoice Date: 0211612017

02424-00001
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

SINGING RWVER HEALTH SYSTEMEMPLOYEES‘ RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMEN

For setvices rendeféd for period through 09/30/2016 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $21,4756.00
Expenses $0.00
Total Current Charges $21,475.00

EXHIBIT

Please refaronce our Involce number with your remitiance.
Dautech Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Straet New Orleans, LA 70130
page 1 of b
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No. 2466 P,
02424-00001 Invoice No: 4993631
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN nvaoice Date: 02/16/2047
AND TRUST
Professlonal Services
DATE 1D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
09/01/2016 SB8S L100  Email thread regarding sefling status conf, 0.20 250.00 50.00
A104 : .
09/02/2016 SBS L100  Emall to Special Mastoer, Britt Singeltary. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A104
09/02/2016 8BS L100  Telephone call with counsel, Charlas Makhail, 0.20 250,00 50.00
A106 -
09/02/2016 8BS L1120  Research plan changes based on new assumptlons from 3.00 250.00 750,00
Ato2  TransAmerica and effect on members,
09/02/2016 SBS  L130° Review revised mode! from Transamerica, Frank 1.00 250.00 "250.00
Al04 Carberry
09/06/2016 SBS L100  Review Order from MS Suprems Court. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A104
09/06/2018 SBS L1600  Telephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Jim Reevas 0.20 250,00 50,00
A104
09/06/2016 SBS L100  Telephone confersnce with counsel, Charles Mikhail. - 0.20 250.00 §0.00
A107
09/06/2016 SBS L1100  Telephone call with counse! Charles Mikhall regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 escrow agreement,
00/06/2016  SBS Revlew sscrow agresment. revise. 0.90 250.00 225,00
A107
09/07/12018 SBS L140  Review and execule revised escrow agreement fro 0.30 250.00 75.00
Al04  Hancock Bank. .
09/07/2016 SBS Email from Special Masler, Britt Singeltary. 0.10 250.00 25.00
Al104

Please rafarence our Invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 7656 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 5
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02424-00001 invelce No: 4993834
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 02/16/2017
ANDTROUST
09/07/2016 sBS 1140  Emall from counsel, Charles Mikhail 0,40 250,00 25.00
A104
09/08/2016 SpS L1000  Meeting with Judge and Spaclal Masler regarding 1.00 250,00 250.00
A109 guidance on courl oversight and administration.
09/06/2016 sBS L4130  Review prior request for proposals from SRHS for 7.00 250.00 1,750,00
A110 Trustee Services
09/09/2016 sBs L1100 Plan and prepare for next week 1/4 Meeting with 7.00 250,00 1,760.00
A101 Fiduciary Vest. Assel allocafion adjustment and fund
manager review.
09/12/2016 SBS L1130  Emall from Joey Beattie regarding ranewal of fiduciary 0.50 250.00 125.00
A107 policy with altached policy applicalion for review,
09/12/2016 SBS L110  Continue Raview/Revision of RFP for Benefit of Actuary 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
A103 Services
09/13/2016 spS L1120  Continue Raview/Revision of RFP for Benefil of Actuary 4,00 250.00 1,000.00
A101 Services '
09/13/2016 SBS L1130  Review Plan investments and fund managers for Mesting 4,00 250.00 1,000.00
A101
09/14)2016 58S 1130 Telephone con!. with Mike Doweil regarding planA 0.40 250,00 100.00
A107 investment opportunilias.
09/14/2016 s8s  L110  Review asset allocation amendment recommendalions. 4,00 250,00 4,000.00
A103
09/15/2016 sBS L1130  Review malarlals provided by Fiduciary Vest for quarterly 4.00 250.00 1,000.00

A104 meeting regarding Schroders, Sit Investment and
. .—-MetWest mutual fund.

09/15/2016 SBS
Afo4  Quarterly Plan and Trust Mealing with SRHS officials
and Fiduciary Vest representatives.

09/15/2016 8BS Meeting with Cree Cantrell of Edward Jones Invesiments

A104 regarding investment opportunity..

09/19/2016 sps L1130
A106

Call with Joey Bealy regarding fiduciary policy.

Travel fo Singing River Hospitalfreturn for allendance' ;l-' '

406 255.007 " "1,000:00

.50 250.00 375.00

0.20 250.00 50.00

ttance.

Please reference our invoice number with your remi

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 76§ Magazine Street New Orlaans, LA 70130

Page 30f5




Aor. 4 2017 9:32AM

Denham law firm

No. 2466 P

02424-00001 Involce No: 4983631

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN nvolce Date; 02/16/2017

AND TRUST

09/20/2016 sS85 L130 Draft/Qutline and discuss web page(s) and setup for 7.50 250.00 1,875.00
Af03  lrustee page creation with Jonah Blum,

09/21/2016 S8S L100  Plan amendments oplions/variables. 1.00 250.00 250.00
A102

09/22/2018  SBS L100  Research possible plan amendments 3.00 250,00 750.00
A102

09/26/2016 S8S L1430 Call from Alan Salg, invastment advisor, 0.10 250.00 25.00
A106

09/26/2016 S8S Revlew proposal for web page from Jonah Blum 0.50 250.00 125.00
A106

09/27/2016 SB8S 1100  Recelve and reviaw CHUBB leller from counsel. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104 )

09/28/2018 SBS L100  Emall from Joey Bealtie regarding fiduciary policy 0.20 250,00 50.00
A104

09/26/2016 SBS Prepare polenlial CHUBB fitigation for administrative 7.00 250.00 1,750.‘00
A102  cost. policy provislons and exlsting defense cost

qualification.

09/29/2016 ShSs Research coverage Issue with respect to CHUBR policy; 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Al0z  including Federal Court ruling, i.e. Dan Webb

09/30/2016 SBS L1100  Receive and review Minutes of March 2 and June 12016 1.00 250,00 250.00
A104  Meelings with atlachments. (232 pages)

09/30/2016 SBS Continua research potential sult against CHUBB for 6,00 250.00 1,500.00
A{o2  administrative cost.

Fee Total 85.90 /hrs 21,475.00

Expenses

Please reference our Invaice number with your remiltance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 766 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

. Page4of 5
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91

No. 2466 P
02424-00001 Invoice Na: 499363.1
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invelce Date: 02/16/2017
ANDTRUST
Timakeepar Summary
Timekeeper Nams Hours Raie Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 856.90 250.00 $21,475.00
Totals : 85,80 ] §21,476.00
ToRUAToUNE R R TR0,

Please reference our Involce number with your remittance.

Peutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 5 of 5




Apr. 4 2017 9:32AM  Denham law firm No. 246
0. 2466

IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF J ACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPL
INRE: Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust

Almond, et al. v. Sigging River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2014-2653
Thompson, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2695
Bosarge, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2729
Aguillax, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, ¢t al, v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0027
Eiland, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, er al.; Cause No. 2015-0030
Lay, etal.v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

THE SPECIAL FIDUCIARY’S MOTION FOR -
APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF HIS FEES AND EXPENSES

Stephen B. Simpson, Special Fiduciary in the captioned causes of action, moves the court
for entry of an order approving payment of his fees, and in support thercof would show the court
the following:

1. The Special Fiduciary has performed reasonable and necessary services in

- cpmetion i th adiistaton of e, Singing River eath Systom Employees Retrement
Plan and Trust (“Plan and Trust”) and the pending litigation relating thersto, as reﬂected in thz
invoice for services rendered for the period of time November 1, 2016, through November 30,
2016, attached hereto as Exhibit A.

‘Wherefore, premises considered, the Special Fiduciary prays that upon review and
consideration of this motion and supporting exhibit, and any objections to the motion and replies

to those objections, the court enter an order finding that the sexvices of the Special Fiduciary as

P. 98




A
pro 42017 9:30AM Denham taw firm
No. 2466

" reflected in the invoice attached as Exhibit A are reasonable and necessary, and approving

payment of this invoice.

Respectfully submitted, this /& day of Febmary, 2017.

Speci Fiduciary

Stephen B, Simpson (MS Bar No, 6809)
Deutsch Kerrigan, LLP.

2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

Telephone: (228) 864-0161

Facsimile: (228) 863-5278

.99




Apr. 40 2017 9:32AM Denham law firm
No. 2466

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

ay served a copy of the foregoing

I, the undersigned counsel certifies that he has thisd

by electronic

Special Fiduciary’s Motion for Approval and Payment of His Fees and Expenses

mail on the following:
‘Harvey Barton, Esq.
Earl Denham, Esq.
Cal Mayo, Esq,
Tim Reeves, Esq.

Brett Williams, Esq.

This Zé day of February, 2017,

P.

100
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Denham law firm

peutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Sulte 1001
Gulfport, MS 38501
Telaphone: (228) 864-0161 Fax: (228)B63-6278
FEIN  72-0929299

No. 2466 . 101

1nvolce Noi 5015871

02424-00001

nvolce Date; 0210712017

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENY PLAN
.

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT
For services rendered for perod through 14/30/2016 in conhection with:

Reference NO. 02424-00001

Fees $11,625.00
* Expenisés - <-e 0 §0.00 R
Total Current Charges $11,626.00

EXHIBIT

A

@bbles

Please raference our Invoice numbar with your romittance.

Doutsch Kervlgan LLpP - 756 Magazine Straet New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 of 4
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02424-00001

DATE
11/01/2016

11/01/2016

11/02/2016

11/02/2016
11/03/2016
14/03/2016 |
1410472016 .

14/07/2016

" (10712016

11/09/2018

11/09/2016

11110/2016

Denham law firm

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN

D
$BS

SBS

SBS

SBS
s8s
8BS
SBS

SBS

SBS™

sB8S

SBS

s8S

No. 2466  P.

Involce No:
involca Data:

6016871
02/07/2017

Professional Services

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
1100  Revlew of financial performance of individual investment 7.70 250.00 4,925,00
a1  funds for mesting with Fiduciary Vest.
L{10  Emall from Cal Mayo, counsel for plaintiffs ~ 0.40 250.00 25.00
A104 )
100 Travelto Ocean Springs Hospital and conduct Quarlerly 4,00 250.00 1,000.00
A109 Plan and Trust meeting with hospital officials, Transamerica

and Flduciary Vest representatives. Presentation from

nvestment Flrm M Capital Management. Retum travel

(o Gulfport. y

Review quarterly financial report of fiduciary Vest, 3.00 250.00 750.00
A109 minutas of previous mtg and presentation of 1l Capital in

preparation of mesting,
1130  Amendment of COLA payment calculation and ellgibility - 7.60 250.00 1,900.00
A101 Model of Savings tmpact. ’

Email from Frank Carberry, TransAmaerica regarding 0.40 250.00 100.00
A107 COLA calculation. With attachments,
L1430  Telephone call from Joey Bealtle regarding fiduciary 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107 polley.

Emall to Cal Mayo 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107
-w--= ~Emailo counsel, Charles. Makhail. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107 ) T e e
L100  Email from SRHS, Kerry Calderelli regarding invoice 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 payments.

Review data from Transamerica ragarding CPl increase 1.80 250.00 450,00
Aod  for payment of COLA 1o beneficlaries.
1130  Review financial performance 3.50 250,00 875.00
A101

Please referance our invoice nurober with your remitiance.
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 4
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Apr. 4. 2017 9:33AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 P 103

02424-00001 invoice No: 5016871
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN involce Date: 02/07/2017
ANDTRUST

14/10/2016 SBS 1130  Revlew 15 investment performance reports from Kerry 4.20 250.00 1,050.00

Af04  Caldarolliwith SRHS

14/11/2016 sgS 1100  Emall from Stewait Sneed and Hawes with policy and 0.50 250,00 125.00
af07  invalce. Review same.

14/16/2016 sps  L100  Emall from Garalyn Davis with attached involce for 0.50 250.00 125.00
A7 review and submlssion to TransAmetica,

14/17/2016 SBS L130  Review Oct.2016 investmenl performance report. 0.50 260.00 125.00
A104
11/17/2016 GBS 1130  Email Oct. 2016 financial report to counsel for Jackson 0.10 250.00 25.00

A107 County, Billy Guice.

1112112016 88S 1210  Review and analyze 5th Clr, Brief of Appellaes (84 1.60 250.00 400.00
' Al04  Pages) v

11/22/2016 $B8S Telephone message lo Jason Small, Fiduciary Vest 0,20 250.00 50.00
Al04 regarding trust summary requested at {ost maeting.

14/22/2018 spS  L100  Recelve and review involces from TransAmerica for 1.50 250,00 375.00
At07  payment Review same.

11/22/2016 8BS L100  Email to Kemy Calderelii regarding payment of Invoice. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 -~
11/23/2018 sBS 1130  Planand prepare financlal disclosure including cola 7.70 250.00 1,925.00

A101 pa_wments

11/29/2016 sBs  L130 Telephone.confwilh Mike Dowell regarding investment 0.40 250.00 100.00
o ..o .pqo7 - opportunity. .

11/30/2016 SRS L130  Review spreadsheet from SRHS, Craig Summerlin 0.50 250.00 425.00
Af04  fegarding COLA payment calculations.

Foe Total 48.50 Mhrs 14,625.00

Expenses

Please reference our Invoice numbar with your remittance.

peutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 756 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 4
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No. 2466 P
02424-00001 Invalca No: 6016871
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 02/07/2017
AND TRUST v
Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 46.50 250.00 $11,625.00
Totals 48.50 $11,625.00

Tt Aot B g (s e 7

Pleasa refarance our invoice humber with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 766 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 4 of 4
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Aor. 40 2017 9:33AM  Denham law firm No. 2466 = P. 105

IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI
IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust

Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2014-2653
Thompson, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2014-2695
Bosarge, et al, v. Singing River Health System, ez al.; Cause No. 2014-2729
Aguillar, ef al, v. Singing River Health System, e al.; Cause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al, v, Singing River Health System, e al.; Canse No. 2015-0001
Browun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0027
Eiland, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ez al.; Cause No. 2015-0030
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

THE, SPECIAL FIDUCIARY’S MOTION FOR
APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF HIS FEES AND EXPENSES

Stephen B. Simpson, Special Fiduciary in the captioned causes of action, moves the court
for entry of an order approving payment of his fees, and in support thereof would show the court
the following;

1. The Special Fiduciary has performed reasonable and necessary services in
connection with the administration of the Singing River Health System Employees’ Retirement

~ " Plan and Trust (“Plan and Trust™) and tli'e'pehai'h'g litigation relating thereto, as reflected in the
invoice for services rendered for the period of time December 1, 2016, through December 31,
2016, attached hereto as Exhibit A.

Wherefore, premises considered, the Special Fiduciary prays that upon review and

consideration of this motion and supporting exhibit, and any objections to the motion and replies

to those objections, the court enter an order finding that the sexvices of the Special Fiduciary as




Apr. 4. 2017 9:33AM Denham law firm

reflected in the invoice attached as Exhibit A are reasonable and necessary, and approving

payment of this invoice.

Respectfully submitted, this 45 day of Febmary, 2017.

Stephen B. Simpson (MS Bar No. 6809)
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14™ Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

Telephone: (228) 864-0161

Facsimile: (228) 863-5278

No. 2466  P. 106

Special Fiduciary




Apr. 4 2017 9:33AM . Denham Taw firm No. 2466 P 107

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, the undersigned counsel certifies that he has this day served a copy of the foregoing,
Special Fiduciary’s Motion for Approval and Payment of His Fees and Expenses by electronic
mail on the following:'

Harvey Barton, Esq.

Earl Denham, Esq.

Cal Mayo, Esq.

Jim Reeves, Esq.

Brett Williams, Esq.

This 46 day of February, 2017,

N B. §t

&%%%ﬁ f,wﬂ
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Deutsch Kerrigan LLLP

2510 14th Street, Sulte 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0181  Fax: (228) 863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001 Involce No: 503011
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 017312017
AND TRUST -

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 12/31/2016 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $675.00

Expenses $0.00
Total Current Charges $675.00

EXHIBIT

A

Please reference our Involee number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10f3
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02424-00001 . Involce No: 503011
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 01/31/2047
AND TRUST
Professional Services
DATE ID DESCRIFTION HOURS RATE ~ AMOUNT
12/01/2016 SBS L1130  Recieve and review Aetos' updated October 2016 0.60 250.00 125.00
A104  performance report for pension plan portfolio
12/01/2016 SBS L1100  Receive from Kerry Caldarelll October statementa and 1.60 250.00 375.00
A104  review same.
12/02/2016 SBS L130  Receive email with attachment from fiduciary Vest, 0.50 250.00 125.00
A104  Review and execute documents required for new
investment with Triple-l, Scan and retum emaf),
1213/2016 SBS L1100  Emall from Charles Makhall regarding hearing.” 0.10 250.00 25.00
A106
12/14/20186 SBS  L100  Email from counsel, Charles Makhail regarding Cal Maye  0.10 250,00 25.00

Alo7  Trequest

Fee Total 2.70/hrs 675.00

Expenses

Please reference our inveice number with your remittanca,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Padge 2 of 3
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02424-00001 tinvoica No: 603011
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invaice Date: 01/31/2017
ANDTRUST .
Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 270 250,00 $675.00
Totals 2,70 $675.00
Tolal Ameint B 66 tis Ihygiée™ - 157 I T LR U s g4

Please reference our invoice pumber with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrlgan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 3




IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI
INRE: Smgmg River Health Syst(,m Fmployees Retirement Plan and Trust F! LE D

p o
Altnond, et al. v. Singing River IIealth System, et aly Cause No. 2014-2653 %%OC 0 3 2015
24\ b

Thompson, et al. v, Singing River Health System, ez al; Cause No.2014-2695  TE MILLER, CLERK
Bosarge, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No, 2014-2729 BM
Aguillar, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ez al.; Cause No. 2014-2753 |
Dany, et al. v. Singing River Health Systerﬁ, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0001

Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No, 2015-0027

Eiland, et al. v, Singing River Health System, e al.; Cause No, 2015-0030

Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, e al.; Cause No, 2015-0060)

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came befplgé,'the Court on llnofidh ore tenus of Stephen B, Simpson, the
Special Fiduoiary for and : on behalf:. of Jjéhe Singing River Health é)rstem

'Exnployges’ Retirement Plan and'fr’déﬁ :(“Ketlfré-ment Trust™) for authority to pay Deutsch

Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having considered the same
finds, Orders and Adjudges:

I. Invoice No. 483625 dated Nove‘mbex: 30, 2015, :Submi'tted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP whi.ch covers the period of Se.pt;:mbcr 16., 2015, through October 30, 2015, is hereby

approved for payment by the Retirement Trust,

2, The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment

by the Retirement Trust. /J N@/ﬂﬂ%r%
ORDERED AND ADJUDGFD this Lhe g __day of ek, 20135,

\ t\‘ uf"‘ llhﬁ
vt . .

o Attested o u"
0 ba.a true copy of original
Fxleda\ WLy 3 oo |

Tervy Miller, Chancery Clerk

n Cexlnly, L\/TIoSISSlppl
BV@”@M se.




Submitted by:

7 zzmﬁ%

CSTRPEYN % MSB # 09)
Specxal F Lducxary Tr on behalf

the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kertigan, L.L.P,

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

T: (228) 864-0161

F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI

IN RE: Singing River Health System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust F B LE D
' B 2015
Almond, et al. v, Singing River Health System, ef af; Canse No. 2014-2653 - DEC 0 3 2015

Thoinpson, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ez ol Canse No.2014-2695  TE \ Okof%\l..\f , CLERK
Bosarge, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al; Cause No, 2014-2729 BM
Aguillar, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2753
Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et ¢/, Cause No. 2015-0001
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health Systern, ef a/.; Cause No. 2015-0027

Biland, ef al, v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No, 2015-0030
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.;” Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore fenus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on bebalf of the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Rctire@ent~ Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”) for authority to pay Deutsch
Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having consiacred the same
finds, Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 483625 dated Novemiber 30, 2015, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of September 16, 2015, .through October 30, 2015, is hereby
approved for péyment_by_t_l.le_“Retir?ment_ Trust. |

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorizéd to submit the invoice for payment

by the Retirement Trust. ' /aég %
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the g __day of er, 2015,

Attested 85 O o oor
ey

To bea true cony of original & - SPRCTALA '
s oy of orlginallig SPECIAL CHTANCERY COURT JUDGE ™\

Terry Miller; Chancery Clerk
Jaglson Codnty, Mississippi
By@oﬁm bw D.C.




Submitted by:

o Sy=9 S

CSTEFEYIN B, SWSB #6809)
Special Fiduciary T on behalf of

the Singing River Health System
Employees® Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

T: (228) 864-0161

F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001 invoice No:

483625
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 11/30/218
AND TRUST ;

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON. L, BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P O BOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: .
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 10/31/2015 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees $38,617.00
Expenses $16.50°
Total Current Charges $38,633.50

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10of 8




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
inquiry Activity Billed Report (9/16/2015 - 10/31/2015)

Client/Matter: 02424 SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST / 02424-00001

Bill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

) Hours Fees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. Biscount Total
Billed: 155,70 38,617.00 0.00 16.50 0.00 38,633.50
Employee Recap: Hours Fees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. Discount Total
0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 2.20 242,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 242.00 .

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 153.50 38,375.00. 0.00 16.50 0.00 38,391.50




Billed Values

ate Tkpr/Exp Acfivity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees
09/16/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON - 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
RFP's and proposals,
09/18/2045 0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 220 110.00 242,00

Singing River Trust case - Research MS codes and articles for trusts for Steve Simpson, create an indexed book for easy

access and use with a new case he just got In

09/18/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 7.00  250.00
MS Model Trust Act. 99-8-1 et seq.

09/21/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00 250.00
Read and analyze SRHS employee refirement trust agreement. ] ,

09/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8,00 250.00
SRHS financial docs. KMPG annual audits. Home audit. media reports.

09/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00 250.00
Jackson County Court hearing, Meeting with Special Master, Britt Singeltary. Review SRHS financial docs.

09/25/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00
SRHS investment policy and MS Trust Act

09/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 400  250.00
To Jackson County courthouse for hearing on Motion to appoint Special Fiduciary and objections/Return to Guifport.

09/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 3.00 250.00

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . N 0.30 250.00
Telephone call will Will Vankirk of Vankirk invest.ment'svregérdvl fund investments and meeting request,

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.10 250,00
Text from Bab Sawyer regarding fund investment advice.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10  250.00
Text message from Sherman Muths, Muths valuations regarding fund investment and valuation advice.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2.00 250.00
Meeting with counsel for members, Jim Reeves regarding status and mediation.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 480 250.00

review and make recommendations to Term Sheet regarding set{fement on behalf of Trust.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON e ...0:30 25000
Telephone call with Special Master regarding Order and responsibilities described thersin.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 200 250.00

: Review pleadings in State and Federal court cases.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.30  250.00
Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding opportunity to manage trust.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10  250.00
Email from Sawyer investments.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.20 250..00

Meeting with Will Van Kirk, William Van Kirk and Alan Sala regarding trust investment.

1,750.00
2,000.00
2,000.00
2,000.00
2,000,00
1,000.00
750.00
75.00
25.00
25.00
500.00
1,200.00
75.00
500.00
325.00
25.00

300.00

21412017 2:14 PM Page 2 of 5




Date
10/01/2015

10/02/2015

10/07/2016

10/12/2015

10/13/2015

10/13/2015

© 10/13/2015

10/13/2015
10/13/2015
10/14/2015

10/14/2015

10/14/2015
10)15/2015
10/15/2015
10/15/2016

10119/2015

10/19/2015
10/19/2015

10/19/2015

Billed Values

TkpriExp Activity Description ) Qty Rate Amount
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 2,00 250,00 500.00
Plan and Trust Documents, -

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
Pleadings in state and federal lawsuites.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.00 250.00 250.00

Telephone conference call from 10:00 to 11:00 with Breft Williams, Lee Bond, Kevin Holland, Marty Moderson, Celest Oglasby,
Craig Summerlin of SRHS regarding fransition of trustee duties. i

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' 8,00 250.00 2,0Q0.00
Review Latest SRHS Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust Agreement, provided by counsel for SRHS and investment policy.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 200 250.00 500.00

Read and review Investment Policy of the Singing River Health System Employses Retirement Plan and Trust, provided by
counsel for SRHS,

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' ' 030 250.00  75.00

Review SRHS and SRHS Retirement Plan cont list provided by counsel for SRHS
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 190 250.00 475,00

Review Diversified DB Outsourcing Agreement, Diversified Pension Servises Agreement and Diversified Signature Authorization
Form provided by counsel for SRHS.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ) 3.00 250.00 750.00
Review amendments to-SRHS Plan provided by counsel for SRHS (2 inches of documents)

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.70 250,00 175.00
"Review contract with Fiduciary Vest for inveétment advise.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 020 250.00 50.00
telephone call from Vic Welch regarding plan administration interest. V

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3.00 250.00 - 750.00

Meeting at Van Kirk Wealth advisors with Will Van Kirk Sr, Alan Sala, William Van Kirk Il regarding investment advisor interest
presentation.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
Review Investment Statements provided by counsel for SRHS.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10  250.00  25.00
Telephone call to Michael Schlogel, Hancock Bank regarding meeting schedule. ‘

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . - 6.20 250.00 1,550.00
administrative fees and cost analysis per plan documents and quarterly statements .

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.00 250.00 250.00
Review presentation documents from Hancock Bank.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.50 250.00 375.00

Meeting with Hancock Bank executives, Michael Schiogel, Dave Lundgren, Trey Frey, and Brent Fairley regarding
investment,custodial and financial advisement services.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2,00 250.00 500.00
Meeting at Peoples Bank with Chevis Sweatman, Ann Guice and Tom Wicks regarding investment services. V

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.50 250.00 375.00
Review presentation documents from Hancock Bank

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 3.00 250.00 750.00

Compare investment policy against recommended allocation.

211412017 2:14 PM ' Page 3 of §




Date
10/20/2015

10/20/2015
10/20/2015
10/20/2015
10/20/2015
10/21/2015
10/22/2015
10/22/2015
10/23/2016
>1 0/23/2015
10/23/2015
10/23/2015
10/23/2015
10/23/2015
10/2312015
) 1 0/26/2015
10/27/2015
10/2712015
10/28/2015

10/28/2015

TkprlExp Activity Description
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Reclevelreview mark to markel accounting summarles for Aug. and September 2015,
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Toffrom Jackson county courthouse and attend hearing before Judge Breland.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Review/analyze proposed settlement term sheet.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email to Jim Reeves regarding tort claim notice on behalf of Plan and Trust.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Draft recommendations and revisions to settlement term shest.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email response from Jim Reeves regarding tort claims notice
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Taping of news show at WLOX,
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Review submissions by Vankirk wealth invesiments regarding frust administration
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call with Marty moderson regarding plan maodification.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call with Jim Reeves regarding tort claims notice,
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call to Semmes Bobo at Billy Guice office regérding trust fund status.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone calls to fiductary Vest.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call to Stewart sneed and hughs regarding fiduciary Bond.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Review benefit plan and frust for needed amendments as discussed with Marty mordson
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Telephone call with Harold Small, Fiduciary Vest requesting reports.
0864 STEPHEN B SIMPSON T mm——— o T T

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email to Joey Bealtie with Stewart, Sneed and Hewes regarding fiduciary liabilily policy.
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Prepare application for fiduciary liability palicy.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Meeting with Joey Bealtie / Stewart Sneed and Hewes regarding fiduclary liability policy.

2/14/2017 2:14 PM

Billed Values

Qty Rate Amount
0.40 25000 100.00
4.00 250,00 1,060.00
1.00  250.00 250.00
0.20 25000  50.00
2.50 25000 625.00
0.10 25000  25.00
1.00 250,00 250.00
4.50  250.00 1,125.00
0.40 250,00 100.00
0.20 25000  50.00
0.10 25000  25.00
0.20 25000  50.00
0.20 25000  50.00
3.50 250,00 875.00
0.30 250,00  75.00
4,007 250.00

0.30 25000  75.00
460  250.00 1,150.00
1.00 25000 250.00
1.50 250.00 375.00

Page 4 of 5
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Date TkpriExp Activity Description
10/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Billed Values

Qty
0.10

Telephone call with Joey Beattie at Stewart Sneed and Hewes regardin Fiduciary liability policy.

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Telephone call from Ashley Reed, Bancorp South scheduling meeting for tuesday 11/3.

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call from Cree Cantrell/ Edward Jones scheduling meeting.
10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Correspondence from Van Kirk Wealth Advisors. 4 pages
10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON

0.10

0.10

0.30

3.00

Meeting with Cree Cantrell/ Edward jones investments regarding pénsion plan investments.

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

3.00

Rate Amount
250.00 25.00

250.00 25,00
250.00 25,00
250.00 75.00

260.00 750.00

250.00 750.00

Review email submission regarding Plaintiffs (jim Reeves) email and term sheet amendments, and SRHS (Brett Williams) term

sheet amendments as preparation for meeting.
10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON

4.00

250.00 1,000.00

To Jackson County to Brett Williams office to participate in settlement term sheet negotiations/retum to Gulfport.

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

1.50

Review and anylize DRAFT STIPULATION AND AGREEMENT OF COMPROMISE AND SETTLEMENT,

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Return telephone call to Dan Webb regarding Chub coverage issue.

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

0.10

0.70

Telephone call with Dan Webb regarding coverage Issues for SRH System. Trust intervention in dispute.

10/28/2015 E101

Copying

10/29/2015 E101

Copying

211412017 2:14 PM

Totals: 155.70

137.00

28.00

Totals: 165.00

Report Totals:

250.00 375.00

250.00 25.00

250.00 175.00

38,617.00

010 1370

0.10 2.80

16.50
38,633.50
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FILED

IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI  JAN 12 2016

JOSH ELDRIDGE, CLERK

IN RE;: Singing River Healtﬁ System Employees' Retirement Plan and Trust By

Almond, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef af; Cause No. 20 14-2653
Thompson, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et ai Cause No.2014-2695
Bosarge, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Canse No, 2014-2729
Aguillar, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2014-2753

Drury, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.,; Cause No. 201 5-0001

Broun, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0027

Eiland, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause N ' 0.2015-0030
Lay, efal. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No, 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore femus of Stephen B. Simpson, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing Rivér Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”™) J;.or authority to pay Deutsch
Kerrigan LLP’s invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and thé Court having reviewed and
considered the same finds it is reatsonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges:

1. Invoice No. 485754 dated December 17, 2015, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of November 1, 2015, through November 30, 2015, is hereby
~-‘approved-for"paymenf by the Retirement Trust.—— - - e R

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invqice for payment
by the Retirement Trust.

ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the... / ”Z
s‘ 1l

day of January, 2016,

.(n'

4
l

Attested 0¢ (\,Q(
Ta be a frue copy of original O Q8¢
Filed on- \3 20 {0~ 'ZZ/ —
Josh Eldridge, Chiancery Clerk “SPECIAL CI:IANCERY COURT JUDGE

on Co ’cy. Mlsélsslppl R
By @F Q;GL '~::.<I K .,

q\' Cj,“\




Submitted by:

AT

SPEPEHA B. SIMPSON(MSB #6809)
Special Fiduciary Trusteeofi behalf of
the Singing River Health System
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P.

2510 14" Street, Suite 1001

Gulfport, MS 39501

T: (228) 864-0161

F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




Deutsch Karrigan LLP
755 Magazine Street

ég‘ DeU'tSCh K@ﬂ’i gan New Orleans, LA 70130

T. 504 581 5141
deutschkerrigan.com

December 17, 2015

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN
AND TRUST

C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX 2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Our Referenca:  02424-00001

Enclosed please find our firm's invoice for professional services and costs incurred in connection with the handling of
the above referenced matter,

I trust that you will find this statement in order and ask that you please place it in fine for payment at your earfiest
convenience. Please forward your payment fo:

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
755 Magazine Street
New Orleans, LA 70130

if you have any questions regarding the Invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me.

With kind regards, 1 rerain

Cordially, {
MW |

STEPHEN B, SIMPSON




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 39501
Telephone; (228) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001 ) Invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 121712016

ANUTRUST K

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
- C/O HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

P OBOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

For services rendered for period through 11/30/2015 in connection with; _

Reference Na. 02424-00001
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

Fees $30,825.00

Expenses : : $0.00
Total Current Charges ‘ $30,825.00

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 10f8




02424-00001

Invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 1211712015
AND TRUST
Professional Services
DATE 1D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
11/02/2015 SBS L130  Prepare and plan for quarterly trustee meeting and 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A01  Investment recommendations from Fiduciary Vest.
11/03/2015 SBS 1130  Review Fiduciary Vest Investment Performance 3.40 250.00 850.00
Ao4  Evaluation Report for the perlod ending September 30,
2015, (101 pages) _
11/03/2015 SB8S L1130  Altend Meeting with Ashley Reed and Trust Department 1.60 250.00 375.00
Atog  head from Bancorp South regarding investment
opportunities.
11/03/2015 SBS L1130  Review email and attachment from TIR investment, Tim 0.80 250.00 200.00
At04  Hartigan regarding recommendation on investment
amendment at trustee meeting 11/4.
11/03/2015 SBS L130  Telephone call with Joey Beattie regarding fiduciary 0.10 250.00 25.00
ato7  lability policy,
11/04/2015 SBS L1100  Travel tof from gulfport office to Singing river hospital for 1.50 250.00 375.00
Af12  frusiee meeling.(45 min each way)
11/04/2015 SBS 1270  Singing river trustee meeting. 2.80 250.00 700.00
A109
11/04/2015 SBS L110  Receive and review Proposed amendments to the 1.50 250.00 375.00
Al04  agreements of Eastern Timberland Opportunities U, Inc.
and ETO Hl operating Partnership. L.P.
Amendments to SRHS Trust invesiment TRI.
11/04/2018 SBS " L100  Prepare for Trustee meeting, Sept. minutes, agenda and 2.50 250.00 625.00
At0{  review fiduciary Vest 3/4 report.
11/05/2015 ... SBS L1100 ... Review correspondence dated Nov, 4th from Jim Reeves 0,20 250.00 50.00
A104 fo Judge Hilburn, Singletary, Houston and Simpson. LT,
- 11/05/2015 8BS 1130  Telephone call with Morgan Stanley jackson MS 0.50 250.00 125.00
Al0o7  regarding investment services. Meeting request.
11/05/2015 sBs L1100 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A101

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
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02424-00001

invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Daie: 1211712016
AND TRUST
11/06/2015 sBs  L110 8.00 250,00 2,000.00
A102 '
11/098/2015 SRS L100  Email with document attachment from Jim Reeves. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107 ’
11/09/2015 sBS Email from Jim Reeves with draft agreement attached. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A10T
11/09/2015 SBS L1160  Review and analyze settlement (draff) proposal 1.00 250.00 250.00
A104
11/09/2015 SBS 6.30 250.00 -1,575.00
A102 .
11/10/2015 SBS L100 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102
11/11/2015 SBS L1100 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A103
11/12/2015 SBS L110  Telephone call from employee/ Tadlock regarding tort 0.20 250.00 50.00
Alos  claims notice
1171212015 SBS L1110  Email tort claims nofice to employee Tadlock. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A106
11/12/2015 sgs  L130  Email from counsel for SRHS celest Ogelsby regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
Af07  tele conf. with TransAmerica. Response
11/12/2015 SéS 1160 Recieve and review latest setilement draft from Jim 1.00 250.00 250.00
Alog4  Reeves.
11/12/2015 SBS  L130 Meeting with Cree Cantrell /Edward Jones investments 1.00 250.00 250.00
) Afog  regarding investment services. '
1111212015 sBs L1430 Meeting with Victer Walsh / Mallette Administrators, Inc 1.00 250.00 250.00
Afog  regarding investment administration.
11/12/2018 SBS L1130  Review financial investment presentation from Edward 1.70 250.00 425.00
Aoq  Jones.

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 758 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
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02424-00001 Invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 1211712015
ANDTRUST
11/12/2015 SBS  L110 3.00 250.00 750.00
A102
11/13/2015 sBS 1130 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A104
11/16/20186 SBS L130  Telephane call with Marty Moderson regarding Order for 0.20 250.00 50.00
Afo7  Plan amendments and wednesday conf.. call.
11/16/2015 8BS L160 Receive/ review proposed draft of settlement documents ~1.80 250.00 450,00
: A104 and exhibits.
11/16/2015 8BS L100 Receive and review SECOND CORRECTED ORDER 0.60 250.00 150,00 -
Afp4  appointing Special Fiduciary Trustee
11/16/20156 SBS L1100  Telephone call with Special Master, Britt Singeltary. 0.10 250.00 25.00
’ A107 ' '
11/16/2015 SBS L1000  Meeting with financial investment vendor for : 5,00 250.00 1,250.00
Adog  presentation/ proposal, Cree
1171612015 SBS L100  telephone call to Marty Moderson regarding Second 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107  corrected Order
111162015 SBS L100  Telephone call to Celest Ogelsby regarding Second 0.10 250.00 25.00
Af07  corrected order.
11/16/2015 sBS 1100 Telephone Conf. with Marty Moderson. 0.30 250.00 75.00
Al07
111712015 SBS L100  Revise Second Corrected Order appointing Special 1.00 250.00 . 250.00
Aos  Fiduciary Trustee.
111712015 SBS L100  Email to counsel for SRHS, Celeste Ogelsby regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
S - “= aqo7 O Second Corrected Order— e o
11/17/2015 SBS L1100  Telephone call with counsel for Plaintiffs, Jim Reeves 0.30 250.00 75.00
Afo7  regarding Stipufation and settlement agreement.
11/17/2015 SBS L160 Email to Jim Reeves regarding Stipulation and 0.20 250.00 50.00
Afo7  seltlerment agreement.

"Please reference our invoice number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
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02424-00001 Invoice No: 486754

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invaice Date: 1214712015

ANDTRUST

11/17/2015 sBS L160  revise stipulation/settiement agreement regarding 6,10 250.00 1,525.00
A103 contribution payments, et al

11/17/2015 SBS L100  email from counsel forSRHS, Kelly Sessums regarding 0.10 250.00 - 25,00
Af07  Ssecond correcled order.

11/18/2015 - SBs L100 Telephone conf. with SRHS counsel, Marty Moderson 1.00 250.00 250.00
Afo7  and representatives of Transamerica regarding coli .

: check et al. .
11/18/2015 sBS  L130 Tele;')hone conf. with Lee Bonb SRHS GFO, Celest 0.50 250.00 125.00
‘ Afo7  Ogelsby, Marty Moderson regarding Coli benefit and
] recommendation to SRHS Board.

11/18/2015 sES  L100  Receive and review 2009 letter to-members regarding 1.70 250.00 425.00

Af04  coli benefit. review Plan and Trust document regarding
coli benefit formula. review Transamerica pension
modeling document dated 9/9/2015

11/18/2015 SBS 1160  Review latest stipulation and settlement draft from jim 0.90 250.00 2256.00
A104 Reeves.

11118/2015 SBS L1110  Email from Nicole Tiliman regarding Coll. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107

11/18/2015 sBs  L110 email from Frank Carberry @ TransAmerica regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
Af07  pension plan model.

11/18/2015 SBS L1100  Receive and review Second Corrected order draft and 1.50 250.00 375.00
A103 proposal from Marty Moderson Order

11/18/2015 SBS L1100  Email from counsel for SRHS, Celest Ogelsby. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A107

11/18/2015 S8S  L100 Telephone call to Fiduciary Vest, Jason Small, 0.10 250,00 25.00
AtQ7

11/18/2015 SBS L1110 Review plan documents and financial status to defermine 2.00 250.00 500.00
Afo3  coli benefit recommendation.

1111972016 SBS Telephone conf. with Lee Bond, Kevin Holland and Marty 0.70 250.00 175.00
A102  Moderson regarding 2015 COLI benefit.

11/19/2015 SBS Draft and revise notice to beneficiaries per Plan 2.00 250.00 500.00
Aoz requirements on 13th check. email to Lee Bond, et al for

comments.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.
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02424-00001

Invaice No: 486754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN invoice Date: 1211712015
AND TRUST
11/19/2015 SBS Telephone message to Jason Small, Fiduciary Vest. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A102
11/19/2015 sBs ' Telephone call from counsel for plaintiffs, Jim Reeves 0.20 250.00 50.00
Af02  fegarding latest proposed stipulation and settlement
agreement. :
11/19/2015 SBS L110 Telephone call with Jim Reeves regardind settiement 0.40 250.00 100.00
A107 and stipulaiion.
11/49/2015 s8s  L120 13th check memo and justification basis. 2.00 250.00 500.00
A103
11/19/2015 8BS L210  Circulate revised Second corrected order revisions and 2.00 250.00 500.00
Aio3  make changes .
11/20/2015 SBS L130 telephone conversation with-Jason Small, Fiduciary Vest 0.30 250.00 75.00
Afo7  regarding monthly accounting and reporting of trust
principal balance.
11/20/2015 sBSs L1100 Telephane call with SRHS counsel, Brett Williams 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107 regarding emergency board meeting 1:00 today.
11/20/2015 SBS L1110  Make final revision to 5.06 notice leiter regarding 13th 0.50 250.00 125.00
Atp3  check.
11/20/2015 SBS L100  Attend emergency special meeting of the Board of - 3.00 250.00 750.00
Alog  trustees of SRHS to discuss 13th check issue. Travel : .
toffrom gulfport to Gautier.
11/20/2015 SBS L1000  Telephone call with SRHS ceo , Kevin Hofland. 0.20 250,00 50.00
A107
11/20/2015 sBsS  L100 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A103
{1/23/2015  SBS _ L100  Revise 13th check notice with changes from Board 1.00 25000  250.00
A103 meeting. o o T e
11/23/2015 SBS L1100  Telephone call with Kevin Holland, SRHS. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A1Q7 .
11/23/2015 SBS L100  Email to Nicole Tillman regarding conf. call: 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107

Please reference our Invoice number with your remitfance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
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Expenses

02424-00001 Invaice No: 485764
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 1211712015
ANDTRUST
11/23/2015 SBS L100  Telephone co.f with special board meeting of SRHS to 0.50 250.00 125.00
Afo7  recommend payment of 13th check.
11/25/2015 SBS L1100  Email thread with Kevin Holland regarding: notice to 0.30 250.00 75.00
Ag7  tetirees of 13th check and web posting.
11/30/2015 SBS L1100  Telephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Jim Reeves’ 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107  regarding settlement proposal, Mation fo sever.
11/30/2015 s8s L1110 Email to counsel for plaintifs, Earl Denhém regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
Af07  Mmeeting request..
11/30/2015 SBS Email response from Earl Denham office regarding 0.10 250.00 25.00
Ao7  meefing request.
11/30/2015 §BS 1210 Petition to approve 13th check and corresponding Order. 0.80 250.00 200.00
A103
11/30/2015 sSBS L1110 telephone call with counsel for plaintiffs, Earl Denham 0.10 250.00 25.00
At07
11/30/2015 SBS. L120 Meeting with counsel for plaintiffs, Earl Denham | 1.20 250.00 300.00 '
A107  regarding future joint efforts to benefit Plan and Trust.
11/30/2015 SBS L160  Telephone conf. with court and parties. 0.50 250.00 125.00
A107
"Fee Total 12330 /hrs 30,825.00

Please reference our Involce number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Strest New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 7 of 8




062424-00001 Invoice No: 485754
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 12/17/2018
AND TRUST
Timekeeper Summary
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 123.30 250.00 $30,825.00
Totals . 123.30 $30,825.00

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Date . Invoice Billed Credits Bafance
Total Outstanding Balance $0.00

Pléase reference our Invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130
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IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPL F ! L E D

IN RE: Singing River Health System Emplpj{éfes"_Retirement Plan and Trust MAY 06 2016 '
. J
Broun, ef al. v. Singing River Health System, ef af.; Cause No. 2015-0027 B?SH ELDRIDGE, CLERK
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et al.; Cause No. 2015-0060

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FliDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on rn‘otion ore tenus of Stephen B, Sixnpéon, the
Special Fiduciary for and on behalf of the Singing Ri'ver Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retirement Trust”‘) for authority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduéiary fees, and the Coﬁrt having reviewed and co.nsiderle;i the same
finds it is reaéonable and: fajr, and Orders and Adjudges: |

1.~ mvoice No. 489502 dated March 18, 2016, submitted by -Deutsch Kerrigan
LLP which covers the period of February 1, 2016, through February 29, 2016, is hereby

approved for payment by the Retirement Trust.

2. The Special Fiduciary is hereby authorized fo submit the invoice for payment
by the Retu ement Trust. M/
’ MJ/Z
ORDERED AND ADIUDGED this the é day of KA , 2016.
SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT IUDGE -
Submitted by: o ,f, ] f/; s
.,'?S‘i’ v *o e "-';
""'.:ou by , . (.CE 71
és:YEPEfm B. SM@LL{MSB é’o9) Special Fiduciary en T a,; '
Trustee on behalf of the Smglng River Health System '-,‘r‘f'ii,ﬂ" C ;"
Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust ; u’\ ﬁw s
Deutsch Kerrigan, L.L.P. . Attosted
th : ’ . esie
%}Sullgpéit lf/;rSeet’;’:QS‘SuOltle ! To.be a true ooe/ of ongmal O(M
’ : Filed.}
T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278 ‘deh Eifidge, Shosy Gk

ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com

Aghaon C)c;gnty; Mi&inssupplD .




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Gulfport, MS 38501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax: (228) 863-5278
FEIN  72-0929299

02424-00001 Invoice No: 489502
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN [nvoice Date: 03/18/2016
AND TRUST .

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/O HON, L, BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

POBOX2114

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE: '
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for perlod through 02/29/2016 in connection with:
Reference No. 02424-00001

Fees : $29,450.00
Expenses $0.00

Total Current Charges $29,450.00

Please reference our invoice number with your remiftance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 of 6




02424-00001 Invoice No: 489502

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 03/18/2016

ANDTRUST

Professional Services

DATE ID DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT

02/01/2016 SBS L1 00 Prepare for Special Fiduciary Website development. 4,00 250.00 1,000.00
A101

02/01/2016 SBS L1100  Website creation for Special Fiduciary and beneficiaries. 4.00 250.00 1,000.00
A101

02/02/2016 sBS L1120 Research Pension plan early buyout options.. 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102

02/05/2016 SBS L110.  Early buyout of defined benefit healthcare and pension 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
A102  Pplans nationwide.

02/08/2016 SBS - L100 Research potential restructure of pension plan 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
Aoz Investments.

02/10/2016 8BS L130  Review and research Fiduciary Vest investments and 7.40 250.00 1,850.00
A102  fund portfolio.

02/10/2016 SBS L1110  Telephone call with Jim Reeves, counsel for Plaintiffs 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107  regarding Earl Denham correspondence.

02/10/2016 SBS L1140 Telephone call with counsel, Jim Reeves regarding Dec.. 0.20 250.00 50.00
Ado7 31,2015 market value for website publication.

02/10/2016 SBS L1110  Email to Jim Reeves 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107

02/10/2016 SBS  L110 Review earl denham Letter regarding recusal. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A104

02/11/2016 SBS Review and research SRHS employee pension plan and 7.20 250.00 1,800.00
Aoz ltrustinvestment plan restructure potential.

02/11/2016 SBS  L100 Review Transamerica invoices for admin and actuarial 0.50 250.00 125.00
A104  servises.

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 6




02424-00001 involce No: 489502
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Data: 03/18/2016
AND TRUST
02/11/2016 SBS Telephone call with Les Bond regarding Transamerica 0.30 250.00 75.00
Al04  Invoices.
02/11/2016 SBS 1110  Email to Lee Bond with TransAmerica attachment. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A107
02/12/2018 8BS Ihvestment plan restructure pofential research. 6.80 250.00 1,700.00 -
‘ A102
02/12/2016 SBS L1130  Telephone conference with Morgan Stanley, Mike Dowell 0.50 250.00 125.00
: Afo7  regarding investment plan,
02/13/2016 SBS  L110 Email from Lee Bond regarding TransAmerica invoice. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
02/15/2016 SBS . L210  Review/ analyze PITITION FOR CITATION FOR 0.50 250.00 125.00
Ao4  CONTEMPT OF COURT AS TO L.BRELAND HILBURN
AND FOR OTHER RELIEF,
02/15/2016 SBS 1110 Email from Jim Reeves regarding Denham petition.. 0.20 250.00 50.00
' A107
02/15/2016 SBS L110  Email from Lee Bond regarding Rate on investments. 0.20 250.00 50.00
A107
02/15/2016 SBS SRHS pension plan investment reports and from 6.90 250.00 1,725.00
Aoz sawyer investments.
02/16/2016 SBS L1110  Review email and attachment regarding Chub Fiduciary 0.80 250.00 200.00
Alo4  Coverage for potential claim for of fiduciary expenses.
02/16/2016 SBS L110  Email from counsel, Charles mikhail regardin Chub 0.10 250.00 25.00
A105 litigation.
02/16/2016 SBS L1215  Review Motion to dismiss appeal 2.00 250.00 500.00
A104
02/16/2016 SBS L2110 Review SRHS response to federal insurance co motion 2.00 250.00 500.00
Al04 to stay.
02/16/2016 SBS L130  Review analyze January Trustmark financial reports from 2.00 250.00 500.00
Atoa  fund managers

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 3 of 6




02424-00001 Invoice No: 489502

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 03/18/2016

ANDTRUST

02/17/2016 SBS L1130  Conclude review of trustmark financial reports for Jan, 2.00 250.00 500.00
Afo4 2016

02/17/20186 SBS L250  Review and research for response fo Motion for 6.50 250.00 1,625.00

Afoz  contempt.

02/18/2016 SBS L1100  Email to Fiduciary Vest, Jason Small regarding quarterly 0.20 250.00 50.00
A103  Ppension plan trustee meeting.

02/18/2016 SBS Continue preparation for response to Denham/Barton 2.80 250.00 700.00
A1o2  motion for recusal.

02/18/2016 SBS  L210  Research response to Barton/Denham S.Ct. Motion, 4.00 250.00 4,000.00

A102

02/19/2016 SBS Prepare response to Denham/ Barfon S.Ct. Motions. 4.00 250,00 1,000.00
A102

02/22/2016 8BS L1i00 ~ 6.00 250.00 1,500.00
A102

02/23/2016 SBS L1100  Email from Kiissan Dykes, SRHS regarding Trustee 0.20 250.00 50.00

A107 meeting.

02/23/2016 s§BS L110 6.00 250.00 1,500.00
A102

02/24/2016 8BS L110 5.00 250.00 1,250.00
A109

02/25/2016 SBS 1130 B : 5.00 250.00 1,250.00
A109 :

02/26/2016 sBS L130 5.00 250.00 1,250.00
A109

02/29/20156 SBS Review email and attachments from Chris Jones. 0.30 250.00 75.00
A104  Eastern Timberland Opportynities II, Inc. .

02/29/2016 SBS L1330 Review revised December Pointer statement, Wedge 1.50 250.00 375.00
Ato4  Jan 16 Statement and Jan. 2016 Elliott statement from
. Kerry Caldarelli, (80 +- pages)

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan L.LP ~ 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 4 of 6




02424-00001 _ lnvoice No: 489502

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTENM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 03/18/2016
AND TRU=T

Fee Total  117.80/hrs 29,450.00

Expenses

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 5 of 6




02424-00001 Invoice No: 489502

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN invoice Date: 03/18/2016
AND TRUSTI

Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Amount
STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 117.80 25000  $29,450.00
Totals 117.80 $29,450.00
Total:Amount Dye o this Invoice .+ . S . $29,450:00
STATEMENT OF AGCOUNT
Date Invoice Billed Credits Balance
02/24/2016 488317 $32,001.10 - $0.00 $32,001.10
Total Outstanding Balance $32,001.10

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 6 of 6




IN THE CHANCERY COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI F.' i L E D

IN RE: Singing River Health System Bmployees' Retivement Plan and Trust JUN 162016
Broun, et al. v. Singing River Health System, ef al.; Cause No. 2015-0027 051 gpripae CLERK
Lay, et al. v. Singing River Health System, et a/.; Cause No. 2015-0060 By

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF SPECIAL FIDUCIARY FEES

THIS CAUSE came before the Court on motion ore ferus of étephen B, Simpson, the
Special Fiduclary for and on behalf of the Singing River Health System Employees’
Retirement Plan and Trust (“Retivement Trust”) for anthority to pay Deutsch Kerrigan LLP’s
invoice for Special Fiduciary fees, and the Court having reviewed and considered the same
finds it is reasonable and fair, and Orders and Adjudges: |

1., Invoice No. 493337"dated May 26, 2016, submitted by Deutsch Kerrigah LLP
which covers the period of April 1, 2016, through April 30, 2016, is hereby approved for

payment by the Retirement Trust,

2. The Spécial Fiduciary is hereby authorized to submit the invoice for payment
by the Retirement Trust o 72 /
ORDERED AND ADJUDGED this the 5 day of _ L ,2016.

SPECIAL CHANCERY COURT JUDGE

Attestad
To be atrue copy of or‘glnal D %
: AL A ———— Filed g,!lM\L lle eo_L.
‘ ' i '7’ 9), Special Fiduciary Josh Eldridge, Changery Clerk
Tluste on behalf of thé-8inging River Health System Jacksan County, Mgssisgippl

Employees’ Retirement Plan and Trust By \W) A% l Ce —.C.
Deutsch Kerigan, L.L.P. O \L m“ﬁi‘}\j”" /
2510 14" Street, Suite 1001 R ,.“.,Oo,;’w ,
Gulfport, MS 39501 @ o)y

T: (228) 864-0161; F: (228) 863-5278
ssimpson@deutschkerrigan.com




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2640 14th Slreat, Sulle 1001
Gulfport, MS 39601
Telephone; (228) 864-0181  Fax: (228)863-6278
FEIN  72-0029299

02424-00001 ' Involce No

493337
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Dato: 05/26/2018
AND TRUST :

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
G/0 HON, L, BRELAND HILBURN SPECIAL JUDGE

P-0-BOX-2144- ‘

JACKSON, MS 39225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 04/30/2016 in connectlon with:
Reference No, 02424-00001

Fees $22,060,00
Expenses : . $0.00
Total Current Charges $22,060,00

Please referenace out Involcs number with your remittance.
Desutseh Kerrlgan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70430

Page 1 of 4




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
Inquiry Activity Billed Report (4/1/2016 - 4/30/2016)

Client/Matter: 02424 SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM 'E__Mf’!HOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST / 02424-00001

Bill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Hours Fees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. Discount Total

Billed: 88.20 22,060.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 22,050.00

Employee Recap; Hours Fees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. Discount ota

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 88.20 22,050.,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 22,050,00




Billed Values

Date Tkpr/iExp  Activity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees

04/01/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Research Barton Denham pleadings.

04/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ) 1.70 250,00 425.00
Participate in telephone conf, with Transamerica actuarlal meeting et al,

04/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1.00  260.00 250.00
Review SRHS Retirement plan 2016 Valuation results for Conf. call with TransAmerica. o :

04/05/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 6.00 250,00 1,500.00

04/06/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Review and research Supreme court Issues. )

04/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 9.00 250.00 2,250.00

04/11/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00 250,00 2,000.00

Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust "Flnancial Statements and Required Supplementary Information" for year ended
9/30/2015 by Dixon Hughes Goodman, LLP. Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust 9/30 2015 "Report to those Charged with
Governance" by DHG, LLP

04/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 120 250.00 300.00
Confersnce call with Morgan stanley,Sage, et al investment advisors ’

04/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 3.00 250.00 750,00
financial report analysis

04/18/2016 0864 STEPHEN B" SIMPSON 4,00 250,00 1,000.00
Research Sage investment.

04/19/2016 0884 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON 2,00 250.00 500,00
Meeting with counsel, Charles Makhall.

04/19/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2,00 250.00 500.00
Prepare and obtain documents for meeting with counsel

04/19/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4.00  250.00 1,000.00
Revlew supreme court flling and research on Barton Motion for expedited proceedings.

04/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 8.00 250,00 2,000.00
Financlal analysis of April reports, )

04/21/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' ' 3.40 25000 850.00
review research financlal Investor Sage for trust custodian/nvestor,

04/22/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . 7.30  250.00 1,825.00

' review and research Chub/Federal Insurance coverage issue per counsel advice regarding expense of irustee,

04/25/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3.60 260.00 875.00
March financial reports.

04/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 4,00 250,00 1,000.00
Review and anhalyze SRHS plan and trust Annual Report for year ending 9/30/2015,

04/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 3.00 260.00 750.00

Review and analyze SRHS plan and trust agreement "Summary Plan Description.

2/14/2017 2:10 PM Page 2 of 3




Billed Values

Date Tkpr/Exp Activity Description Qty
04/29/2016 0864 STEPHEN 8. SIMPSON 0.10

Emall from counsel, Charles Mikhall regarding recusal of Jackson county Circuit court judges.

04/29/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.00

Review and prepare request for payment of administrative fees to TransAmerica and provide to payor,
Totals: 88.20

Report Totals:

2/14/2017 2:10 PM

Rate Amount
250,00 25.00

250.00 250.00

22,050.00
22,050.00

Page 3 of 3




(Seprmber 2015 )
(O(/bbcw ZOIC)

) Billed Values
Date TkpriExp  Activity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees :
09/16/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 7.00  250.00 1,750.00
RFP's and proposals.
09/18/2015 0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 220 11000 242,00

Singing River Trust case - Research MS codes and arlicles for trusts for Steve Simpson, create an indexed book for easy
access ahd use with a new case he just got in

09/18/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
MS Model Trust Act. 99-8-1 et seq. ' ‘

09/21/2015 0864 STEPHEN B SIMPSON 8.00  250.00. 2,000.00
Read and analyze SRHS employee retirement trust agreement. _

09/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON " 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
SRHS financial docs. KMPG annual audlts Horne audit media reports,

09/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8,00 250,00 2,000.00
Jackson County Court hearing, Meeting with Speclal Master, Brilt Smgeltary Review SRHS financlal docs,

09/25/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 8.00 250,00 2,000,00

' SRHS invastment pollcy and MS Trust Act

09/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ) 4,00 250,00 1,000.00
To Jackson County courthousa for hearing on Motion to appolnt Special Fiduclary and objections/Retuin {o Gulfport, -~ -

09/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 300 250,00  750.00

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSOM 0.30 25000  75.00
Telephone call will Will Vankirk of Vankirk investments regardi fund investments and meeling request.

09/30/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.10 260.00  25.00
Text from Bob Sawyer regarding fund Investment advice,

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0,10. 250,00 25,00
Text message from Sherman Muths, Muths valuations regarding fund Investment and valuatlon advice, .

09/30/2015 0884 STEPHENB, SIMPSON 200 250,00 500.00
Meeting wlth counsel for members, Jim Reeves regarding status and mediation. o

09/30/2018 0884 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . 4,80  250.00 1,200.00
review ana make recommendations to Term Sheet régardlng settlement on behaif of Trust,

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' 0,30 28000  75.00
Telephone call with Special Master regarding Order and responsibilities described therein,

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' V . 2.00 250,00 500.00
Review pleadings in State and Federal court cases, ' A )

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' . 1.30 260.00 325.00
Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding opportunity to manage trust, ‘

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON C 0410 25000  25.00
Emall from Sawyer Investments.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 120 25000  300.00

Meeling with Will Van Kirk, William Van Kirk and Alan Sala regarding trust Investment,

2/14/2017 2:14 PM Page 2 of 5
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02424-00001 Involce No: 488317

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Involce Date: 02/24/2016

ANDTRUST .

Professional Services
DATE ID DESCRIPTION . HOURS RATE AMOUNT
01/04/2016 SBS L2410  Review and research Motion to recuse speclal master 7.00 250.00 1,750.00
: ' A104  and attachments, affidavits. Review and research Motion
to recuse Judge Hilburn, affidavits and attachments, _

01/04/2016 SBS 1210  Review revised complaint for fllinf 1,00 260.00 250.00
A104 :

01/05/2016 SBS L210  2nd Motion to recuse Judge Hilburn, affidavits and 7.50 250,00 1,875.00
Afo4  attachments. Motion to resume discovery, et al, o

01/05/2016 SBS L2910  Email from cou'nsel; Charles Makhail regarding amended 0.20 250,00 50.00
A107  complaint,

01/06/2016 SBS L210  Review Federal court case pleading regarding setttemnt 8,00 250.00 2,000.00
A104  notice and class certification, et al

01/07/12016 SBS 1210  SRHS Motion to strike affidavits, attachments. Special 8.00 250,00 2,000,00
Ato4  fid, Motion/Order to intervene. SRHS Motion to stay

proceedings.

01/08/2016 SBS 1210  Prepare for Motion hearing and responses to motions. 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
A104 .

01/08/2016 8BS L1110  Emalil to counse) Charles Makhail. 0,10 250.00 25,00
A107

01/08/2016 $BS L1140 Email from counsel Jim Reeves, 0.10 250,00 25,00

: A107 '

01/08/2016 8BS L1110  Telephone conf. with counsel, Harvey Barton regarding 0.20 250.00 50.00
Ato7  tort claim notice letters,

01/08/2016 SBS L1110  Email to counsel, Charles Mlkhall regarding tort claims 0.10 250.00 25.00
At05  letters to Harvey Barton, '

01/11/2016 8BS L100  Telephone conf.call with attorney's regarding 1/13/16 0.40 250,00 100,00
Ato7  status/motion hearlng,

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance,

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 765 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 2 of 6
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05/02/2016
05/02/2016
05/04/2016
'05/05/2016
06/06/2016
05/06/20186
05/09/2016
05/09/2016
06/10/2016

06/11/2016

(Mcu-_\ 2Lolw)

Tkpr/Exp  Activity Description
Time Fees
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
‘Revfew financlal statements from Kerry Calderelll,
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
plan and prepare for Federal court fairness hearing testimony.
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
research fairneas hearing burden of broof,et al.
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

plan and prepare for Fed. Ct hearlng. Plan and trust documents and Ms trust code documents.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Emall from Jason Small with f’lduciary Vest . review Sit Investrnent Associates portfolio,

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Fed Ct. claséaction certification hearing preparation.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Email from Greg Figaro with Sage investments,

0884 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Identlfy and prepare documents and potentlal exhibits for falmess hearing.
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Prepare for Fed. Gourt.class certification and fairness hearing

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

* Plan and prepare for Fed, Ct. falrmess hearing.

06/13/2016

06/16/2016

- 05/18/2016

06/18/2016

05/19/2016

06202016

06/23/2016

05/23/2016

08/24/2016

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Meet with counsel and prepare for Fed Court class certification and falrness hearing.
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Meef with counsel/ attend and testify at fairness federal court hequng.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call wih counsel, Charles Mikhall regarding faimess federal court hearing.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Plan and prapare outllne for RFP for investment rﬁanagemant and custodial services
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Plan and prepare RFP for managementfinvestment services,
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Continue analysis of fund managers and fees/basis point cost,
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Emall thread from Kerry Calarelll regarding invoice payments,
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Prepare outline for RFP.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

. Emall from Jason Small, Flduciary Vest conﬁrmlng quarterly meeting and agenda,

05/24/2016

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
RFP proposal draft,

211412017 2012 PM

Billed Values

Qfy Rafe Amount’
480 260,00 1..200.00
400 250,00 1,000.00
7.50 260,00 1,875.00
800 250.00 2,000,00°
160 26000 375,00
6,60 250,00 1,650.00
020 250,00  50.00
700  250.00 1,750.00
800 - 250;06 2,000.00.
450 250.00 1,126.00
8.00 26000 1,500.00
8.00 260,00 2.006Loo
020 26000  50.00
500 250,00 1,250,00
600  250.00 1,500.00
B.OO 250,00 2,000.00
030 26000 7500
7.60 .]zso.oo 1,760.00

020 250,00 - 60.00

600 250.00 1,500.00

Page 2 of 3




( done 201

Contlnue evaluation of RFP for restructuring and amendments o Plan,

2MA12017 2212 PM

. Billed Values
Date TkpriExp  Activity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees ’ ’ .
08/01/2018 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 4,00 250,00 1,000.00
Travel to/ffrom Gulfport to Singing rivér hospital and attend quartquy plan and trust trustee meeling
06/02/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1,00 250.00 250.00 .
Review Opinion and Order Granting Motion for final Approval.of Settlement,
. 0B/03/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00 250.00 2,000.00
Review asset allocation for potential change recommendation of eliminating or reducing Alternatives
06/07/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 1,00 250.00 250.00
Recelve and review SRHS Proposal for freeze calculations from Kim Langlois @ Transamerica
06/07/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ' ' 370 260.00 925.00
Allocation of assets and plan amendment options
06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.00 250,00 250.00
Recelve and review CAPITAL CALL NOTICE, regarding Invesco Morlgage Recovery Loans Feeder Fund.L.P,
and execute payment authoriztion.
06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.00 - 250,00 250.00-
Conference call with Frank Carberry, Transamerica; Lee Bond, SRHS;et al
06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 030 25000 ' 76.00
" Receive and review latter to Bradford & Marzec probation notice.
06/08/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 460 250.00 1,150.00
Plan modification by RFP .
06/13/2016 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON , 7.00 250,00 1,750.00
’ Receive/review investment recommendation from Fiduclary Vest, Sit Investments, Mel West, Vanguard, et al '
1 06/13/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0,50 250.00 125,00
Email from Lee Bond regarding 6/8 call follow-up; and recommendations )
06/14/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ) 8.80  250.00 1,450.00
restructuring models;retireméht age; cola, iﬁ(erest rates, return on Investments, etc.
06/15/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 2.00 25000 500.00
Travel to biloxifreturn and attend meeting with Billy Gulce and Britt Singeltary regarding plan and trust progress.
08/20/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.20 250,00 50.00
Email thread from Greg Figaro and Michael Dowell from Morgan Stanley.
06/22/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 0.20 260,00 80.00
Telephone call with class counsel, Jim Reeves
08/22/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.60 250,00 376,00
Mesting with investment advisor Cree C’anlrell. Edward Johes, '
06/22/2016 0884 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ) 7.00 250,00 1,760,00
- Plan and prepare amendments and restructure of plan options,
08/23/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON S 8.00 250,00 2,000.00
Preparation and plan RFP contenls for amendments and restructure Plan .
06/24/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMFSON 8.00  250.00 2.060.00
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02424-00001 ) Involce No: - 496992

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN Invoice Date: 08/25/2016

ANDTRUST

_ Professional Seivices o

DATE D DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT

07/01/2016 SBS L1110  Email thread with Cal Mayo and Charles Makhail, 0.10 250.00 25,00
A104

07/01/2016 SBS L1410  Email from Donna Broun. 0.10 250.00 25,00
A104

07/01/2016 8BS L100  Email fram Charles Makhall. 0.10 250.00 25.00
A108 D

07/01/2016 8BS L1100  Review financlal records and retirement plan potential 3.50 250.00 875.00
Ato4  plan amendments.

07/05/2018 SBS Email thread with Counsel, Charles Malhail and Cal 0.30 250.00 75,00
A104  Mayo. ' :

07/05/2016 SBS Emails and agresments between Lee Bond, Marty 0.80 250,00 200,00
Af04  Moderson, et al.

07/05/2016 SBS  L130  Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding 1,00 250,00 260,00
Ad0g  bension plan investment opportunity.

07/06/2018 sSBs  L100 Read/review email from counsel,Charles Makhalil. 0,30 250,00 75.00
A107

07/06/2016 SBS L100  Emall thread with counsel, Charles makhall and Cal 0.10 260.00 25.00
Ato7  Mayo '

07/06/2016 SBS L130  Review Monthly Investor Statement for 6/30/2016 from 0,80 250,00 125.00
Al04  Barrow Hanley

07/06/2016 SBS  L130  research potential aMendments to Inveétment plan 2.80 250,00 700.00
A102 ‘ .

(7/07/2016 SBS L130  Attend meeting with Hancock Bank trust officlals 1.50 250.00 375,00
Alog  regarding custodial and investment opportunities, .

Please reference our invoice number with your remittance.

Deutsch Kerrigan LLP « 765 Magazine Stroot New Orleans, LA 70130
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Deutsch Kerrigan LLP

2510 14th Street, Suite 1001
Guifporl, MS 39501
Telephone: (228) 864-0161  Fax; (228) 863-5278
FEIN  72-0928299

02424-00001 Involce No; 483625
SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN involce Date: 11/30/2015
ANDTRUST -

SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST
C/Q HON. L. BRELAND HILBURN, SPECIAL JUDGE

PO BOX2114 |

JACKSON, MS 38225

RE:
SPECIAL FIDUCIARY TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT

For services rendered for period through 10/31/2015 in connection with:
Reference No, 02424-00001

Fees ' © $38,617.00

Expenses ) $16.50"
Total Current Charges ' $38,633.60

Please reference aur invoice number with your remittance,
Deutsch Kerrigan LLP - 755 Magazine Street New Orleans, LA 70130

Page 1 of 8




Deutsch Kerrigan LLP
Inquiry Activity Billed Report (9/16/2015 « 10/31/2015)

Client/Matter: 02424 SINGING RIVER HEALTH SYSTEM EMPLOYEES' RETIREMENT PLAN AND TRUST /02424-00001

Bill Attorney: 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp.

‘ Hours Fees Disgount _ Total

Billed: 155,70 38,617.00 0.00 16.50 0.00 38,633.50

Employee Recap: ours Fees Cash Exp. Non-Cash Exp. Discount. Total

0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ 2.20 ‘ 242,00 0.00 0.00 0,00 242.00
163,60 38,375.00 0.00 16.50 0.00 38,391.50

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON




Billed Values

Date TkpriExp Activity Description Qty Rate Amount
Time Fees . C
09/16/2016° 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . 7.00 250,00 1,760.00
RFP's and proposals. C ‘
09/18/2015 0800 COLLEEN NUNEZ : 220, 110.00 242_.00

Singing River Trust case - Research M8 codes and articles for trusts for Steve Simpson, create an indexed book for easy
access and use with a new case he just got in

09/18/2615 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . ' 7.00 250,00 1,750.00

' MS Model Trust Act, 99-8-1 et seq.

09/24/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON Co 8.00 250,00 2,000,00
Read and analyze SRHS employes refirement trust agresment,

09/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
SRHS ﬂnan_cial docs. KMPG annual audits, Horne audit, media reports. ‘

00/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
Jackson County Court hearing, Meeting with Special Master, Britt Singeltary, Review SRHS financlal docs,

09/25/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 8.00  250.00 2,000.00
SRHS investment poltcy and MS Trust Act i

09/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 4.00 250,00 1,000.00
To Jackson County courthause for hearing on Mation to appoint Speclal Fiduclary and objections/Return to Gulfport;

08/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON v 3,00 250,00 750,00

'09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . ' 0.30 250,00 75.00
Telephoné call will Will Vankirk of Vankirk investments ragard! fund investments and mesting request.

09/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ’ 010 26000  25.00
Text from Bob Sawyer regarding fund investment advice.

09/30/2018 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' . 0.10 26000 25,00
Text message fram Sherman Muths, Muths valuations regarding'fund Investment and valuation advice, ' '

09/30/20186 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . 2.00 250,00 500.00
Meeting with counsel for members, Jim Reeves regarding status and mediation.

09/30/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON T 480  250.00 1,200.00
review and make racommendations to Term Sheet regarding seltlement on behalf of Trust,

10/01/2015 0864 STERHEN B, SIMPSON 0,30 250,00  75.00
Telephone call with Special Master ragarding Order and responsibilities described therein,

10/04/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 2,00 250,00 500.00
Review pleadings In State and Federal court cases. ,

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1.30 25000 325,00

7 Meeting with Bob Sawyer, Sawyer Investments regarding opportunity to manage trust.

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10 ' 25000  25.00
Emall from Sawyer invesiments. .

10/01/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' 120 265000 300.00

Meeting with Wil Van Kirk, William Van Kirk and Alan Sala regarding t'rus( investment.

2011412017 2:14 PM . ) Page 2 of &




Date
40/01/2015

10/02/2015

10/07/2015

10/12/2016

10/13/2015

10/13/2015

10/13/2016

10/13/2015-

10/13/2016
10/14/2016

10/14/2015

10/14/2015
10/15/2016
10/16/2016
10/156/2015

10/19/2015

10/19/2015
10/19/2045

10/19/2015

Billed Values

TknriExp Actlvity Description . Qty | Rate Amount
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . 2,00 250,00 500.00
Plan and Trust Documents, .

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ) I 4.00  250.00 1,000.00
Pleadings In state and federal lawsuites. ' ’
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' 100  250.00  250.00

Telephone conference call from 10:00 to 11:00 with Breit Williams, Lee Bond, Kevin Holland, Marty Moderson, Celast Oglesby,
Cralg Summerlin of SRHS regarding transition of lrustee dutiss.

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ’ © 800 250.00 2,000.00
Review Latest SRHS Employses' Retirement Plan and Trust Agreement, provided by counsel! for SRHS and Investment poilcy.
0864 STERPHEN B, SIMPSON 2,00 250,00 500.00

Read and review Invesiment Pollcy of the Singing River Health System Employees Refirement Plan and Trust, provided by
counsel for SRHS,

0864 STEPHEN 8, SIMPSON ‘ 030 25000 7500
Review SRHS and SRHS Retlrement Plan cont list provided by counsel for SRHS
0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 190 26000 476.00°

Revlew Diversified DB Quisourcing Agreement, Diversified Pension Servises Agreement and Diversified Signature Authonzation
Form provided by counsel for SRHS,

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ‘ . 3.00 250.00 750.00
Review amendments to SRHS Plan provided by counsel for SRHS (2 Inches of documents) ’

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . : 0.70, 25000 175.00
Review contract with Fiduclary Vest for investiment advise,

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON . . 020 250.00 5000
telephone call from Vic Welch regarding plan adiministration interést, ’

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 300 25000 750.00

Meetlng at Van Kirk Wealth advisors with Will Van Kirk Sr, Alan Sala, William Van Kirk il regarding investment advisor interest
presentation.,

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 400 250,00 1,000.00
Review Investment Statements provided by counsel for SRHS. ’

0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 010 26000  25.00
Telephone call to Michael Schlogel, Hancock Bank regarding meeting schedule.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 6.20 260.00 1,650.00
administrative fees and cost analysis per plan documents and quartesly statements

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 1,00 250,00 260.00
Review presentatlon documents from Hancock Bank, . .
0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ‘ 1,60 25000 375.00

Meeting with Hancock Bank executives, Michasi Schlogel, Dave Lundgren, Trey Frey, and Brent Falrley regarding
_ Investment,custodial and financlal advisement services.

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON oo o 2,00 250,00 600,00
Meeting at Peoples Bank with Chevis Sweatman Ann Guice and Tom Wicks regarding Investment services.

0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ‘ 150 250,00 375.00
Review presentatlon documents from Hancock Bank )

0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON . ' 3.00 250,00 75000

Compare Investment policy against recommended allocation,

2/14/2017 2:14 PM . Page 3 of 6




Date Tkpr/Exp Actlvity Description
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Reclevefreview mark to markql accounting summarles for Aug. and September 2015,
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Toffrom Jacksen county courthouse and altend hearing before Judge Breland.
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Review/analyze proposed seltlement term sheetl.
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON v

Email to Jim Reeves regarding tort claim notice on behalf of Plan and Trust.
10/20/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Draft recommendations and revisions to settiement term sheet. ‘
10/21/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON '

Email response from Jim Reeves regarding lort clalms notice
10/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Taping of ﬁews show at WLOX.
10/22/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Revlew submisslons by Vankirk wealth invesiments regarding trust administration
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ‘ '

Telephone call with Marty moderson regarding plan modification.
10/28/2015 0884 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call with Jim Reeves regarding tort claims notice,
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON L

Telephone call fo Semmes Bobo at Billy Guice office regarding trust fund status.
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

Telephone calls to flduclary Vest.
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call to St_ewart shaed and hughs regarding fiduclary Bond,
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Review benefit plan and frust for needed amendments as discussed with Marly mordson
10/23/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON

Telephone call with Harold Small, Fiduclary Vest requesting reports,
10/26/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON '

10/27/2016 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Email to Joey Beattie with Stewari, Sneed and Hewaes regarding fiduciary llability policy.
10/27/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON

10/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON
Prepare application for fiduclary llabllity policy.

10/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON
Meeting with Joey Beattle / Stewart Sneed and Hewes regarding fiduclary lability pollcy.

2/1412017 214 PM

Bllied Values

Qty Rate Amount
040 260.00 100,00

4.00  250.00 4,000.00
1.00 250.00 25000
020 250,00  60.00
250 260,00 625,00
0.10 250,00. . 25,00
1.00 250.00 250.00
450 250,00 1,125.00
0.40 ; 250._00 .1'00.00
0.20 250,00 50.00‘
0.10  250.00 25.00
0.20 250,00  B0.00
0.20 25000  50.00
3,60 | 260,00 875,00
0.30 ‘ 260.00 75.00'
4,00  250.00 1,000.00
0,30 250.00 7.5.00
4.60  250.00 1,160.00

1,00 250,00 250,00

1.60 26000 376.00
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Billed Values

Date TkpriExp  Activity Description : - Qty Rate Amount

10/28/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 0.10 250,00 25.00
Telephone call with Josy Bealtie at Stewart Sneed and Hewes regardin Fiduciary ltabillty policy.

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 010 250.00 25,00
Telephone call from Ashley Reed, Bancorp South scheduling mesting for uesday 11/3,

10/29/2016 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 010  260.00 25.00
Telephone call from Cree Cantrell/ Edward Jones scheduling meeling,

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON 030 25000 75,00
Correspondence from Van Kirk Weaith Advisors, 4 pages .

10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B. SIMPSON ’ 3.00 250.00 750,00

~ Meeting with Cree Cantrell/ Edward Jones investments regarding pension plan Investments.
10/29/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 3.00 250,00 750.00

Review emall submission regarding Plamtlffs (lim Reeves) email and term sheet amendmenls, and SRHS (Brett Williams) term
sheet amendments as preparation for meeting.

10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ’ . 4,00 250.00 1, OOO 00
To Jackson County to Brett Williams office to participate In settlemant term sheet negotlations/return tc Gulfport,
10/30/2018 0864 STERHEN B, SIMPSON 1.50  250.00 376,00-
Review and anylize DRAFT STIPULATION AND AGREEMENT OF COMPROMISE AND SETTLEMENT,
10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON ' .10 - -250.00 - 25.00
Return telaphone call to Dan Webb regarding Chub coverage Issue,
10/30/2015 0864 STEPHEN B, SIMPSON 070 250,00 175.00
Telephone call with Dan Webb regarding coverage Issues for SRH System. Trust intervention In dispute.
Totals: 185,70 38,617.00
Expenses
10/28/2016 E101 137.00 010  13.70
Copying )
10/29/2016 E101 . 7 28.00 0.10 2.80‘
Copying
Totals: 165.00 16,80
Report Totals: 38,633.50
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